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our next meeting. Our pool 
committee has been en-
gaged in the selection proc-
ess along with some inclu-
sions to the contracts. We 
will keep you posted! 

We are also optimistic 
about having a food truck at 
the Clubhouse during pool 
season that would be adja-
cent to the pool area. Imag-
ine sitting overlooking the 
golf course sipping your cof-
fee, iced tea or latte while 
deciding what you want for 
breakfast or lunch. Things 
are looking good and we 
hope to bring this endeavor 
to fruition soon. 

(Continued on page 2) 

nity since we have some pro-
jects already in operation 
and some that are in the 
planning stages. Our Rules 
and Regulations committee 
has gotten off to a great start 
and we look forward to some 
exciting suggestions from the 
committee. As of this writing 
our roofing project is still un-
derway and we are hoping 
for a late January completion 
but we shall see. We are 
also hoping to update you 
soon on the Pool Contractor 
we will be engaging. We 
have several bids and our 
board and administration are 
perusing them now and are 
hoping to make a decision at 

Lifestyle Happenings 

“Lefty” Lefkowitz and Stan “K'“ both point to Lilly Morgan's 
stained glass sun catcher. Lilly has taken advantage of learning 
the art of working in stained glass from these two knowledgeable 
professionals. Come to the Stained Glass Workshop in the Club-
house and see what you can make with their help! 

Photo and caption by Jerry Sperling 

 

By Beverly Eskra  

President 

Clearbrook, we have liftoff! 
The Woodshop Dust collec-
tor has finally passed muster! 
We are sure this is going to 
be great news to our wood-
workers since this project is 
long overdue. The final 
phase of integrating the 
sprinkler system to the dust 
collector has also been com-
pleted and we look forward 
to safely using this system. 
The final touch to all of this is 
the fencing that will complete 
the project. All we can say is 
“It’s about time!” 

2023 looks to be a very 
exciting year for our commu-

CCA President’s Report 

By Donna Galindo, CMCA 

Hello Everyone, 
Well, we made it this far 

without terrible weather. At 
least we have up until I wrote 
this article. Let’s see how we 
get through February. I am 
holding my breath hoping for 
calm. 

It’s that time of year when 
we begin working on Section 
Elections. A call for candi-
dates will be sent to all unit 
owners by mail in the coming 
weeks. This is your opportu-
nity to nominate yourself or 
someone else to run for elec-
tion to your Section Board. 
Please consider running as it 
is a great way to get involved 
in your community, to learn 
and to problem solve, to help 
your fellow neighbors and to 
meet new people. Included in 

General Manager’s Report 

the call for candidates mail-
ing will be the Clearbrook 
Census. We need every-
one’s participation. The Cen-
sus is what keeps our 55 and 
older status and property 
taxes lower. Please be sure 
to return your census to the 
Administration office or drop 
off in the black box outside of 
the Clubhouse in an enve-
lope labeled “2023 Census” 
or by emailing it to: 
rkey@taylormgt.com. You 
can also complete the form 
online on the Clearbrook 
website at www.clearbrook-
nj.com. 

As we look forward to 
spring, we need to remember 
it is still winter. As a re-
minder, please take the time 
to refresh yourself on snow 
clearing procedures. Unit 

owners are responsible for 
the clearance of snow or ice 
below a height of 2 inches. 
The community begins its 
snow clearance operation 
when the accumulation of 
snow or ice exceeds a height 
of 2 inches. The snow clear-
ance procedures are pub-
lished in their entirety in this 
issue. There is ice melt for 
your convenience at the 
Clubhouse and Cultural Cen-
ter parking lots in the white 
bins. 

These was an error in my 
January GM article. The 
phone number for reporting 
your driveway being missed 
when there is a full-service 
snow clearing is 609-664-
5517 or by emailing 
snow@clearbrook-nj.com. 

(Continued on page 2) 

By Krystal Graves 

Lifestyle Director 

Clearbrook, we truly hope 
your calendar is ready be-
cause we have so much in 
store for you in the upcoming 
months! February is going to 
be full of crafting, with Blan-
ket Making, dancing, with our 
$5 Dance, and a little light 
combat with beginner’s self-
defense class. March is even 
more packed with punches, 
so let’s talk about all the 
wonderful things ahead. 

We have two seminars 
slated at the top and bottom 
of March – a Tax Inheritance 
seminar will take place on 
March 1 and a Saint Peter’s 
presentation on Arthritis and 
Joint Preservation will hap-

pen on March 23. 
Early March also brings us 

our annual Club Fair! We 
cannot wait for all of our 
clubs, groups and organiza-
tions to be together in one 
space in the Cultural Center. 
This is a great opportunity to 
get involved and learn more 
about all the active and excit-
ing things that Clearbrook 
has to offer. 

Bob Scott’s Game Show 
Night. If you were not able to 
snag a spot in November for 
Game Show Night, then we 
hope you make your way to 
the Lifestyle Desk to sign up 
for our next rendition. Tickets 
will be $17 per person and 
the event is BYOB. Tickets 

(Continued on page 2) 

Cornhole players, left and above, keep active every Wednesday 
from 5:30 to 7 p.m. The games will continue through March. 

Cornhole 

Comes to 

Clearbrook 

Wednesday night has be-
come cornhole night here at 
the Clearbrook Cultural Cen-
ter. 

All the cornhole boards 
and bags were being used 
by over 24 residents. Many 
of these never played before, 
as you need no experience 
to play and have fun. 

Come on out Wednesday 
nights at 5:30 to 7 p.m. and 
see what all the fun is about! 
Any questions call Larry 
Pepin at 732-677-9316. 
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In Appreciation 

Voice of Clearbrook – Channel 26 

Bring interesting ideas to life,  

the possibilities are endless. 

By Matthew Troncone, 

VOC Producer/Announcer/

Engineer 

Volunteer Spotlight 
This month’s spotlight is on 

you, yes you, and your inner 
voice telling you how cool it 
would be to have your own 
television show.  

We’ve all been there, as a 
child daydreaming about 
playing our favorite super-
hero or being the star of a 
popular sitcom.  

It’s a new year, a fresh 
start, and the opportunity to 
try new things, why not sat-
isfy that inner voice that se-
cretly wants you to be on 
television? 

The Voice of Clearbrook is 
expanding its programming, 
this is your chance to make 
that dream come true.  

Every week you could 
bring your ideas to life. Share 
your experiences, in travel, 
health, or even your favorite 
hobby. The possibilities are 
endless.  

How many times have you 
watched a program and 
thought, “I can do that” or “I 
would have covered that 
topic this way”? Well, now 
you can.  

There is plenty of room for 
new ideas and topics, come 
to a meeting and share your 
thoughts. 

Our next meeting will be in 
the Multipurpose Room on 
February 7 at noon. 

You don’t have to produce 
a show to be “On Air” as an 
announcer you bring the 
Clearbrook activities informa-
tion to the audience while 
supporting the producer dur-
ing a live show.  

It’s a nice way to get your 
feet wet and see if you like 
being in front of the camera 
before committing to produc-
ing a show. 

A few evening slots are 
also available if you work 
and can’t commit to a weekly 
morning show.  

Soon, we will be able to 
program shows in advance, 
so you could tape your show 
and air it later, just like the 

big commercial television 
networks. 

If you are more of a hands-
on person, working with a 
camera may be something to 
consider. This is very similar 
if you ever recorded anything 
with a camcorder back in the 
day. We can have you be-
hind a camera recording spe-
cial events around the com-
munity in no time. 

The engineering of a tele-
vision show is the most so-
phisticated part when we 
broadcast on channel 26. 

This can be learned as 
well; you will be responsible 
for keeping the program on 
the air, playing any media 
the producer has prepared, 
and keeping it all together 
with smooth transitions dur-
ing the show. 

The Voice of Clearbrook 
meets every two weeks in 
the Clubhouse at 12 pm, in 
the Multipurpose Room, to 
set the schedule of shows 
and show titles for the follow-
ing two weeks, as well as 
who will announce, engineer, 
or produce each show.  

Our next VOC meetings 
are on February 7 and Feb-
ruary 21. All are welcome. 
You can also call Ralph Ca-
rito at 609-860-5631 or Mau-
reen Tereshko at 908-202-
6537 for more information. 

As we start a new year, 
look back and think about 
opportunities or chances you 
didn’t take. If being a televi-
sion personality was one of 
them, what are you waiting 
for? 

Recent Shows 
Recent shows on Murphy’s 

Law Tuesday nights at 7:30 
pm have featured, 42nd 
Street, Billy Crystal’s Broad-
way production Mr. Saturday 
Night.  

This past month, our 
weekday morning shows 
included classical, a woman 
in jazz, Crosby Stills, Nash, 
and Young, Tom Jones, 
America, Judy Garland, and 
Liza Minnelli. And of 
course, we covered the 
topic of keeping your New 

Year’s resolutions. 
We welcome artists and 

hobbyists to contact us so 
we can interview/film them 
and their works in their 
homes for upcoming VOC 
shows. If interested, please 
call Stan Brim at (732) 614- 
1277 to set up a short phone 
meeting. 

Channel 26 Is  

Your Central Hub 
Remember, Channel 26, 

the Voice of Clearbrook 
(VOC) cable TV station, is 
your central hub for Clear-
brook news and relevant en-
tertainment. Every weekday 
morning, we broadcast a live 
entertainment show from 
9:30 – 11:30 am. We also 
have a live show on Tuesday 
nights from 7:30 – 9:30 pm, 
and once a month on Friday 
nights. On all other days/
times, Channel 26 features 
scrolling announcements set 
to a variety of great music. 
NOTE: We will be broad-
casting taped shows soon. 
Stay tuned! 

Three Ways to Watch 
Channel 26: 

On your TV: If you have 
Comcast cable TV, just go to 
Channel 26. 

On your computer from 
the Clearbrook website: if 
you don’t have Comcast, or 
otherwise can’t view Chan-
nel 26, go to Clearbrook-
nj.com, click Resident 
Login, and enter your ID 
and password. Then click 
Play on the video that dis-
plays to stream Channel 26 
directly from the web. (If 
you do not have a resident 
sign in, visit the website 
and follow the prompts.) 

In the Clubhouse: View 
the TV next to Activities. It 
plays Channel 26 exclusively 
and continuously. 

Want to know ahead of 
time which shows to 
watch? Refer to the bi-
weekly schedule posted on 
the Clubhouse Activities bul-
letin board, the Channel 26 
TV bulletin board “scroll,” the 
Clearbrook resident’s Face-
book page, outside the TV 
studio room in the Club-
house, or the Clearbrook-
nj.com website (under VOC -
> Morning Broadcast Sched-
ule). 

Lights…Camera… 
Action…Volunteer! 

The Voice of Clearbrook 
meets every two weeks in 
the Clubhouse at 12 pm, in 
the Multipurpose Room, to 
set the schedule of shows 
and show titles for the follow-
ing two weeks, as well as 
who will announce, engineer, 
or produce each show. Our 
next VOC meetings are on 
February 7 and February 21. 
All are welcome. You can 
also call Ralph Carito at 609-
860-5631 or Maureen 
Tereshko at 908-202-6537 
for more information, and/or 
visit us in the studio any 
weekday morning from 9:30 
am – 11:30 am. We will 
teach you what you need to 
know if you decide to volun-
teer. 

 

Manager’s Report 

To assist you in preparing 
your 2022 income tax returns, 
please note the health deduc-
tion for the year 2022 is 
$190.70. You should consult 
your tax advisor as to the de-
ductibility of these services. 

As the weather continues to 
be cold and the power bills 
increase, I thought I would 
share with you some easy tips 
to lower your electric bill and 
possibly save some money. 

· A 10% annual savings 
can be had by turning down 
your thermostat by 10 de-
grees for 8 hours a day 

· Open your window 

(Continued from page 1) 

shades, curtains or blinds to 
let the sun in during the day, 
as that will put less stress on 
your furnace. 

· Even baking or cooking 
at home is an easy way to 
heat up your home during 
the day. 

· Put draft stoppers on the 
doors. 

· Winterize your windows 
with storm windows outside 
or plastic covering inside. 

· Keep your heating vents 
clear of dust and debris. 

Happy Valentine’s Day to 
all. If you are celebrating at 
home, open a bottle of wine 
and turn on the Hallmark 
Channel. There is sure to be 
a sappy movie to enjoy. 

While things are looking up 
for some of our projects, we 
are still battling a “trifecta” of 
respiratory viruses. This 
trifecta, Covid, the flu and 
RSV has been wreaking 
havoc with our health so 
please take care of your-
selves by wearing a mask if 
you are out and about. Wear-
ing a mask properly is also 
extremely important. Please 
pinch the area around your 
nose after applying the 
mask to ensure your pro-
tected. Try not to touch the 
mask or move it around 
with your fingers after plac-
ing it on your face since you 
will be allowing any viruses 
or microorganisms to infil-
trate the mask after applying 

(Continued from page 1) 

CCA President’s Report 

it. A mask is the best protec-
tion we have right now along 
with keeping up with your 
vaccines and boosters. Rest, 
drink plenty of fluids and 
hopefully we can get pass 
this and breathe a little eas-
ier soon. 

We also need your atten-
dance at our open board 
meetings. This is where you 
can learn about what your 
board is working on and an 
opportunity to voice your 
opinion at our open forum. 
We welcome your input, 
take all your comments and 
suggestions into consideration 
and work to ensure that Clear-
brook remains the very best. 

Until next month, have a 
great Valentine’s Day and 
Stay safe! 

are slated to go on sale on 
February 8th. 

Rounding out the end of 
March will be our singles and 
new friends Mix & Mingle 
event. Registration begins on 
February 27 and the cost will 
be $5 per person. We will 
have light refreshments 
available as you mingle with 
your fellow Clearbrook resi-

(Continued from page 1) 

dents. We’ve had many indi-
viduals request a singles 
night, so if you are single and 
looking or just want to make 
new friends, come out and 
enjoy a night of food, fun and 
dancing. There will be a 
complimentary “ice breaking” 
dance class offered by Ball-
room Dance instructor Pam 
Vergoglino. BYOB and don’t 
be shy! We hope to see you 
there with all your single 
friends! 

Lifestyle 

Stanley Hyman was my 
husband for 71 years. He 
died December 6 at the age 
of 98. Stanley was a loving 
husband, and father to Alan 
and Lee. He was loved by 
his grand and great grand-
children. My sons and I 
want to thank our friends 
and neighbors for their 
many cards, certificates, 
trees and other donations. 
Thank you to my canasta 

group for the wonderful food, 
to the Jewish Congregation 
of Clearbrook for the Minyan, 
and to Rabbi Spritzer for his 
Shiva call. There are many 
more too numerous to men-
tion here, but many thanks 
are extended to you all. Also, 
thank you all for your kind 
thoughts and deeds in mem-
ory of my beloved husband 
Stanley. 
Anita, Alan and Lee Hyman 

Did You Know? 

 Movie: Hidden Figures will be shown 
on February 7 and 10 

 Tax Inheritance Seminar – March 1 
 Club Fair has moved from February 23 to March 6 
 Game Show Night is back – March 9 
 Wine Glass Painting Party – March 19 
 Mix & Mingle – singles and new friend mixer will take place 

on March 25 
 Yoga with Rama – Every Monday at 4P, Clubhouse Ball-

room 
 Come play Cornhole! Wednesdays 5:30-7P thru March 

2023 
Keep an eye out! Project Healthy Bones is coming to our 

regular schedule! 

about:blank
about:blank
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Many people start the 
New Year with resolutions 
to eat healthier and exer-
cise more, but you can 
make simple healthy life-
style changes at any time to 
help reduce the risk of 
stroke – the fifth cause of 
death and a leading cause 
of adult disability in the U.S. 
On average, someone in 
the U.S. suffers a stroke 
every 40 seconds, and 
nearly 795,000 people suf-
fer a new or recurrent 
stroke each year. To help 
you reduce the risk for 
stroke, the experts recom-
mend exercising, eating 
nutritious meals, getting a 
good night’s sleep and quit-
ting smoking. 

High Blood Pressure and 
Heart Disease 

High blood pressure, also 
known as hypertension, is a 
leading cause of heart dis-
ease and the biggest risk 
factor for stroke because it 
damages the lining of the 
arteries, making them more 
susceptible to plaque 
buildup. The buildup narrows 
the arteries leading to the 
heart and brain. According to 
the Centers for Disease Con-
trol and Prevention (CDC), 
nearly half of all adults in the 
U.S. have high blood pres-
sure but only a quarter of 
these adults have their con-
dition under control. 

“Physical activity for 30 
minutes a day, five days a 
week, can help lower your 
blood pressure and reduce 
your risk of stroke,” said 
Maria Bartman, BSN, RN, 
CEN, stroke coordinator at 
Saint Peter’s and chair of 
Saint Peter’s Stroke Commit-
tee. “If 30 minutes seems too 
intimidating of a goal, start by 
doing what’s manageable 
based on your physical abil-

Nurse’s Notes:  
 

By Marge Drozd MSN, RN, ACNS-BC, FNP-BC, CSN-NJ 

Director, Community Health Services, Saint Peter’s University Hospital 

ity or schedule and build your 
way up.” 

Proper nutrition can also 
reduce high blood pressure 
and the risk of stroke. 

“For a healthier lifestyle, 
consume a diet that includes 
fish, lean protein, low-fat 
dairy, and is high in fiber by 
including fruits, vegetables, 
beans, nuts and whole 
grains,” said Laura Vetter, 
RDN, CDCES, outpatient 
nutritionist at Saint Peter’s. 
“By reading labels and mak-
ing healthy choices at the 
grocery store, you will incor-
porate nutritious foods into 
your diet.” 

Lack of Sleep 
Not getting enough sleep 

each night can increase the 
risk of stroke. The CDC re-
ports that hypertension, 
stroke, coronary heart dis-
ease and irregular heart-
beats have been found to be 
more common among those 
with sleep disorders than 
those without sleep abnor-
malities. Having trouble 
sleeping? The Center for 
Sleep and Breathing Disor-
ders at Saint Peter’s Univer-
sity Hospital offers testing, 
diagnosis and treatment for 
sleep disorders, such as 
sleep apnea. 

Tobacco Use 
Smoking tobacco in-

creases the risk of stroke, 
making quitting one of the 
most effective ways to im-
prove health and quality of 
life. Saint Peter’s tobacco 
cessation specialists are 
here to help people make a 
life-changing and life-saving 
decision. Ready to break the 
habit? Call Saint Peter’s to-
bacco cessation line at 
732.339.7848. 

Diabetes 
Adults with diabetes are 

twice as likely to have heart 

disease or a stroke com-
pared to others. 

People with diabetes may 
avoid or delay the develop-
ment of heart and blood 
vessel disease by manag-
ing their risk factors. Your 
health care team can do 
periodic testing to assess 
whether you have devel-
oped any of the risk factors 
associated with cardiovas-
cular disease and stroke. 
The Thyroid and Diabetes 
Center at Saint Peter’s is 
comprised of a multidiscipli-
nary team led by dedicated 
endocrinologists with exper-
tise in diabetes who offer 
individualized treatment 
plans for each patient with 
diabetes, including diabetes 
self-management educa-
tion* and nutrition recom-
mendations from the Cen-
ter’s certified diabetes edu-
cators. 

Time=Brain 
Time is of the essence 

when it comes to stroke. 
Early stroke detection and 
treatment are key to improv-
ing survival, minimizing dis-
ability and reducing recovery 
times. 

BALANCE-Does the per-
son have a sudden loss of 
balance? 

EYES-Are they experienc-
ing blurred or double vision 
in one or both eyes? 

FACE-Ask them to smile-
does one side of their face 
droop? 

ARMS-Ask them to raise 
both arms-does one arm drift 
downward? 

SPEECH-Ask them to re-
peat a simple phrase-is the 
speech slurred or strange? 

TIME-If you see ANY of 
these signs, call 9-1-1! 

If you have any symp-
toms of a stroke, or notice 
a loved one experiencing 
symptoms, call 911! 

This article has been modi-
fied from Saint Peter’s 
Healthcare System’s January 
2023 Community Calendar. 

Become a Healthier Version of You:  

Living Better Can Reduce the Risk of Stroke 
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The Boomers 

Club 

By Frank Casey and  

Steve Rudin 

The Boomers Club held its 
membership meetings and 
Board of Directors Election 
on Friday, January 13. Re-

elected to the board were 
Frank Casey, and Loretta 
Migliore. Newcomer Mary 
Ellen Allocca was also 
elected to the board. Janet 
Martino was given an interim 
position on the board, to fill a 
vacated seat. Congratulation 
to the 2023 Boomers board 
officers. Frank Casey, Presi-

dent; Steve Rudin; Vice 
President; Liz Strazza, Sec-
retary; and Tommy Tompkins 
Treasurer. 

The Boomers Club will be 
hosting its annual Super 
Bowl Party, on Sunday, Feb-
ruary 12 in the Cultural Cen-
ter. Come out and watch the 
game on the BIG screen TV. 
The doors will open at 5 pm. 
This event is open to ALL 
Clearbrook residents, their 
friends and family. Please 
join us and show off your 
own team colors while you 
cheer for whichever teams 
will be playing in the big 
game. We’ll have a hot 
“finger foods” buffet setup, 
with chicken wings, White 
Castle sliders, Swedish 
meatballs, Frank’s own 
homemade Southern chili, 
and coffee and dessert. This 
is a BYOB (no hard liquor) 
event. 

Ticket price is just $20 pp. 
Tickets went on sale Tues-
day January 24. Additional 
ticket sales dates are posted 
on our website. 

Are you a little bit inter-
ested in knowing what we 
have going on in 2023? 
Please visit with us at 
www.boomersofclearbrook.c
om 

The Boomer’s Club is the 
place to be if you’re looking 
to meet people, make new 
friends and forge lasting rela-
tionships. 

For additional information 
about joining the Boomers 
Club, please contact our 
President Frank Casey at 
fcasey69@hotmail.com or 
our Vice President Steve 
Rudin at srud58@outlook. 
com. Please feel free to visit 
our website for more info 
about the club. www.boom 
e r s o f c l e a r b r o o k . c o m /
home.html. Dues are still $10 
pp annually. 

 

Art Appreciation 

Club 

By Paula Davis 

We had some wonderful 
speakers and a fantastic art 
exhibit in the months before 
the winter set in. Now we are 
waiting for things to settle 
down and we are planning 
for future meetings. 

Please keep your eyes 
peeled to the Clearbrook 
Channel 26 to find out what 
is happening. 

Hope the new year is off to 
a good start for all. See you 
soon! 

The Boomers of Clearbrook, Inc., elected the new Board of Directors for 2023. From left are: Ellen 
Sherman, Liz Strazza, Frank Casey, MaryEllen Allocca, Tommy Tompkins, Loretta Migliore, Sheila 
Fichera, Steve Rudin and Janet Martino (unable to attend). 
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dessert, a tray of Italian 
cookies was placed on each 
table, and carafes of coffee 
were served as well. A sweet 
ending to finish our meal. 

Gary played all our favorite 
music as he sang and 
danced along. As always, the 
music was great. It seemed 

(Continued on page 6) 
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www.clearbrook-nj.com 

were set up on both sides of 
the room with delicious hot 
food, salad, bread and but-
ter. Pitchers of water were on 
each table. While we were 
eating our dinner, high com-
pliments to the caterer could 
be heard. Lou invited us to 
come up for seconds and we 
graciously complied. For 

Fiber Arts Club 

By Chris Brenner 

A Happy Valentine's Day 
to Everyone!! 

A happy event for Febru-
ary! 

We are looking forward to 
the Club Fair on March 6 at 
the Cultural Center from 4- 8 
p.m. We will be there with 
the other clubs! You will be 
able to view some of our 
members’ creations and 
meet friendly members, too. 

See our members at work 
now in our photo in this edi-
tion of the Courier. The nee-
dles are flying! 

In February, you may see 
our Holiday Tree sprouting 
Valentine hearts instead of 
regular holiday ornaments. 

A warm Welcome to sev-
eral new members of the 
club! If you would like to join 
us, just come on down to the 
Ceramics Room in the Club-
house on a Monday. We are 
there 1 to 3 every Monday or 
call Chris' answering ma-
chine at 609-395-6825 for 
more info and I will return 
your call asap! 

PS We celebrate birthdays 
once a month with a cake 
made by Donna Malley! 

 

Italian American 

Club 

By Medele De Filippo 

Ciao amici. Spero che 
state bene. Hi everyone! I 
hope this finds you well. 

On Saturday, December 
10, we held our annual 
Christmas Party at the Cul-
tural Center. Tables were 
beautifully set with center-
pieces created by JoAnn 
Rago and Marie Schiumo, 
and a lovely decorated 
Christmas tree was dis-
played on stage. A big 
thanks to Santa’s elves who 
helped with the set up; Diane 
Davis, Maryann Kraemer and 
Pat Czerwinski. And many 
thanks to Rick Davis who 
sells our popular 50/50 tick-
ets. 

Guests picked up their 
place cards and after every-
one was seated, we pledged 
to our flag and President Lou 
DiMeglio announced the 
names of those celebrating 
December birthdays and 
wedding anniversaries. Our 
favorite DJ, Gary Morton, 
was poised and ready to 
start calling table numbers so 
the feast could begin. Tables 

The ladies of Fiber Arts display their January projects. 
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and a dual-layer air filter that 
promises to catch inhalable 
particles and noxious gas-
ses. A duct on each earcup 
allows clean air to flow into 
the visor, which sits around 
the lower half of your face 
without touching it. 

Much of the tech at CES is 
ready for primetime, but 
there also was a glimpse of 
the big ideas that may or 
may not come to fruition. 
Some of the most intriguing 
concepts from the show were 
cars provided by automobile 
makers Chrysler, Dodge, 
Peugeot and BMW. Honda 
and Sony have a new ven-
ture called Sony Honda Mo-
bility that displayed an Elec-
tric Vehicle (EV) under the 
brand name Afeela. The idea 
is that the cars will eventually 
be able to drive themselves, 
allowing passengers to relax 
with content created by 
Sony, like games, movies, 
and even AR-like experi-
ences. With these types of 
products on the drawing 
boards, 2023 and subse-
quent years should be inter-
esting from a technology 
point of view. 

 

Duplicate Bridge 

By Jayne Levy-Carol 

In Memoriam 
Barbara Leviton died on 

December 28, 2022. I met 
Barbara six years ago when I 
moved to Clearbrook after 
marrying Stan Carol. Barbara 
was the Director of the Clear-
brook Bridge Club. Stan is an 
avid bridge player and wrote 
the bridge column for the 
Courier. 

Barbara was confined to a 
motorized wheelchair. She 
greeted me warmly. She was 
genuinely happy that Stan 
had remarried. Barbara was 
starting a Beginner’s class at 
the Middlesex library and she 
asked me to join. We were 
about seven people crowded 
around a couple of snack 
tables in the entrance hall. 
Barbara was patient with 
each of us. Her enthusiasm 
for bridge was contagious. 
She never complained; al-
though she was in chronic 
pain. She was happy to 
share her notes and outlines 
which she asked the library 
to copy for us. She fought 
hard not to let her pain and 
her disability detract from her 
responsibilities. 

Eventually, Barbara contin-
ued her class at her own 
kitchen table. A couple of the 
students joined the Clear-
brook Club. The loss of sev-
eral members from Covid 
affected the group and all the 
members. Barbara’s disabil-
ity increased in severity dur-
ing the past four months. 
She could no longer drive 
and could not get out of her 
car by herself. Nevertheless, 
her spirit and commitment 
were valuable to keeping the 
group intact with hope for 
expansion and renewed vital-
ity. She will be sorely 
missed. 

However, the group is now 
meeting twice a week: Mon-
days and Thursdays from 
12:30 to 4 p.m. in the Club-
house. They welcome play-
ers of any level. Come on 
over and bring a partner. 

Chik Chikas, Marie and Vin-
nie Curto, Bernice Fitzgerald 
& Tim Casatelli,Cathi and 
Joseph Messina, Nelly and 
Ron Sorensen 

Before signing off, let me 
leave you with this: Why 
some husbands shouldn’t 
take phone messages - 
“Someone from the Gyna 
Colleges office called. 
They said your Pabst Beer 
was normal. I didn’t even 
know you liked beer.” 

Happy Groundhog Day, 
Happy Valentine’s Day, and 
for those of you who are still 
working, enjoy your three-
day President’s Day week-
end. With the observance of 
Ash Wednesday, the Lenten 
season begins. 

Arrivederci, buona salute a 
tutti. So long and good health 
to everyone. 

 

Clearbrook  

Computer Group 

By Hal Wexler 

On January 5th through 
the 7th Las Vegas was home 
to the 56th Consumer Elec-
tronics Show (CES). After an 
all-digital event in 2021 and a 
dreary in-person show last 
year, CES finally was back to 
normal in 2023. In addition to 
improved hardware like sleek 
new laptops, foldable smart 
phones and new solid-state 
drives with 13 Gigabyte 
read /write capability there 
were lots of innovation on 
display. The coolest part of 
CES is the wealth of new 
product designs. 

One such new product is 
the Lenovo ThinkBook Plus 
Twist. It’s a 13.3-inch laptop 
with both a normal display 
and a second 12-inch color 
ink display on the reverse 
side. With a center post 
hinge that allows horizontal 
rotation between front and 
back displays, the Twist lets 
you use the regular display 
for most work and provides 
the option to switch to E-Ink 
to save battery life, rest your 
eyes from bright screens, or 
just use the machine as an E 
reader or a notepad. Another 
attention grabber at CES 
was the 93-inch LG wireless 
TV. The new wireless TV 
uses a built-in receiver in the 
screen, paired with the LG 
Zero Connect box which 
wirelessly transmits a 4K 
video signal along with multi-
ple audio formats. LG's new 
Zero Connect technology, 
can broadcast HDMI-quality 
signal from up to 30 feet from 
the TV. As a result, aside 
from the power cord, the TV 
is cable-free. With a 30-foot 
range, you can set up other 
devices like Blu-ray players, 
game consoles, or a cable 
TV set-top box on one side 
of a room, with the TV 
mounted elsewhere. If you 
are into futuristic devices the 
Dyson Zone Air-Purifying 
Noise Cancelling head-
phones meet that require-
ment. This marks Dyson's 
first venture into both audio 
and wearable technology. 
The Zone is the first air puri-
fier designed specifically for 
the face. The device, aims to 
combat outdoor air and noise 
pollution. Inside each ear cup 
is a tiny compressor motor 

that everyone knew the 
words to all the songs and 
sang as loud as they could to 
join in the fun. The floor was 
filled all night with dancers 
showing their talent. Our club 
can boast of terrific dancers 
that’s for sure. We saw some 
fancy stepping out there on 
the floor. Very impressive, 
kids! 

And then we were ready to 
hear the lucky ticket numbers 
called. We had ten $20 cash 
winners and, in addition, 
eight people were the win-
ners of a bottle of wine. Plus, 
at each table there was one 
person who got to take home 
the centerpiece. Our Christ-
mas party was a big hit and 
we are delighted that so 
many were able to attend. 
Thank you all for being an 
important part of the celebra-
tion. 

Mark Your Calendar and 
Please Note Change: Our 

(Continued from page 5) 

Italian American 

Club 

first 2023 meeting is sched-
uled for Tuesday evening at 
7:30 p.m. on March 28 in the 
Clubhouse Ballroom. Al-
though we have always held 
our meetings in the Cultural 
Center, another function has 
been booked for that room 
on that night, and we have 
been moved to the Club-
house Ballroom to hold our 
March 28 meeting. Please 
make a note of this. If there 
are any changes, we will 
post a notice on the Clear-
brook channel. As we ap-
proach the startup of our 
2023 club meetings, we in-
vite you to consider joining 
our board to be a club officer. 
We welcome any new ideas 
and suggestions you might 
have. We will address this at 
our March meeting, so it 
might be something you 
would like to think about in 
this new year. 

Trips: Monday, February 
13, 2023, to the Resorts Ca-
sino in Atlantic City. Please 
call A/C Trip Coordinator, 
JoAnn Rago (609-655-4482) 

if you wish to join us for the 
day. You are always wel-
come and so are your 
friends. And you might have 
“Slots of Fun.” 

Interested in Joining? 
We always welcome new 
members, and if you are in-
terested in joining, please 
call Vice President Marie 
Schiumo (609-409-9931). 
Everyone in Clearbrook is 
invited to join. 

Happy Birthday wishes 
in February (birthstone: 
Amethyst) (flower: Violet) 
to: John Begodt, Loretta 
Brower, Annette Bruno, Sal 
Celentano, Carmela Co-
maianni, Sal Coraci, Vinnie 
Curto, Kenneth Doctors, 
Anne D’Ambrosia, Marie 
Dowling, Karen Musso, Carol 
Parkhurst, Robert Pendolino, 
Frank Puglisi, Carmen Santi-
ago, Marsha Satzman, 
Janice Sias, Martha Sperling, 
Eleanor Strasser, Joanne 
Strausman, Bonnie Tornheim 

Happy Anniversary 
wishes in February to: Lucy 
and Bob Carlucci,Margo and 



FEBRUARY 2023 — PAGE 7 The Clearbrook CourierThe Clearbrook Courier  

Reminder 

Please 

Pick Up 

After 

Your 

Dog. 

By Pat Castrucci 

A new year is like a blank 
book; it has 12 chapters, 365 
pages, and you are the au-
thor. Our wish is that this 
year you write the most 
beautiful story possible for 
yourself. HAPPY NEW 
YEAR to all Clearbrook 
friends. 

Winter is upon us. Get out 
of the cold and come on in to 
the Billiard Room; our mem-
bers are waiting to greet you. 
The club has been active 
and we are looking forward 
to more new members, both 
men and women. As a rre-
minder, The Billiard Club is 
open seven days a week 
from 8 am to 10 pm. All 
equipment, including cue 
sticks, balls, chalk, is avail-
able in the Billiard Room for 
everyone to use. 

Antonio’s holiday festivities 
were a success. It was a 
pleasant evening with friends 
and new members. We cele-
brated the achievement of 
three members honored with 
trophies for most improved. 
(Pat Castrucci, Joseph Paul 
and Louis Scfuri.) 

The Billiard Club still pro-
motes and supports The 
Food Bank. 

A Little Bit of Trivia: 

Interesting Facts 
about Pool 

The term “Poolroom” now 
means a place where bil-
liards is played, but in the 
19th century a poolroom was 
a betting parlor for horse rac-
ing. Billiard tables were in-
stalled so patrons could pass 
the time between races. The 
game billiards and the pool-
room became connected in 
the public’s mind. Today, the 
two terms are used inter-
changeably. Pool is one of 
the safest sports in the world. 

The dome on Monticello, 
Thomas Jefferson’s home, 
conceals a billiard room. In 
Jefferson’s day, billiards was 
illegal in Virginia. 

Tom Cruise did his own 
billiard shot for the 1986 film, 
The Color of Money, except 
for one in which he had to 
jump two balls to sink an-
other. Director Martin 
Scorsese said he wanted to 
let Cruise learn the shot, but 
it would have taken two extra 
days of practice, which would 
have held up production and 
cost thousands of dollars. 
The shot was instead per-
formed by professional bil-
liard player, Mike Sigel. 

See ya in the next ‘Rack 
‘Em Up’ 

Clearbrook 

Democratic Club 

By Patricia L. Schwalje 

The Democratic Party of 
Clearbrook is wishing all the 
residents of our wonderful 
complex a loving February 
2023 and a Happy Valentine 
Day. 

In 2023 Monroe has the 
positions of Mayor, and two 
Council-at-Large seats up 
for reelection. There also 
will be races for Middlesex 
County and New Jersey. 
Republicans have promised 
they will be asking tough 
questions. Democrats will also 
ask tough questions and hold 
Republican candidates ac-
countable for truth, and con-
crete policies. The next meet-
ing of the Clearbrook Democ-
ratic Club will be on February 
13 at 7 p.m. in Lounge A of the 
Clubhouse. The club meets 
the second Monday of each 
month. 

The Democrat Club of 
Clearbrook pledges to up-
hold American democracy, 
the “Rule of Law” and the 
Constitution. 

By Bill Turkus 

This may be informing too 
late for some, but it is cold 
enough for water pipes to 
freeze. Disconnect your 
hoses and sprinklers that 
are connected to the out-
side wall hydrant (the valve 
on the side and or in front 
of your unit). 

Make sure you know 
where the main shut off 
valve is in your house and 
that you know how to shut 
off the water. If it is difficult 
to turn or in a location that 
is not accessible, consider 
calling a plumber to have it 
moved. 

Know where the outside 
curb box is (the outside 
shut off) and that it is un-
covered and accessible. 
Remove shrubs or ground 
cover so that it can be 
found quickly. Damage to 
your unit doubles and tri-
ples every minute that you 
waste getting the water 
shut off. 

Find a plumber or two. 

Keep their numbers readily 
available.  In f reezing 
weather the plumber will be 
too busy to get to you im-
mediately. Be prepared to 
be without water until they 
get to you. Knowing how to 
shut off your water on your 
own can save you from a 
lot of grief. 

Remember insulating 
pipes does not prevent 
freezing. It just takes a little 
longer for a disaster to hap-
pen. Be prepared. Know 
what to do. Have a good 
disaster plan. Don’t allow 
replaced pipes to be in-
stalled in unheated places 
like the attic or outside 
walls. 

If you are leaving for any 
extended period of time, 
winterize the house, shut 
off the water. In a bad 
storm the power may go out 
for an extended period of 
time. Shut off the water, 
leave all the faucets open 
to allow for ice expansion. 

FEBRUARY

By Ellen Tischio 

A new year has recently  

begun 

It's nice to meet with Family 

and Friends and have some 

fun 

February has some Special 

days 

They are celebrated in 

Different ways 

During Black History Month, 

we can Recognize, Honor and 

make a Fuss 

For all the Contributions Black 

Americans have given to us 

On Valentine's Day, it’s Cards, 

Candy and Flowers 

With those we Love, we can 

spend Hours 

On President's Day we can 

celebrate 

All the Presidents we think are 

Great 

On Groundhog Day, there's 

just One Thing 

We hope he will predict an 

Early Spring 

It’s Freezing Outside 
Rack ‘Em Up” 
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unconditionally through thick 
and thin, yes, through all the 
days of our life. As we cele-
brate Valentine’s Day and tell 
our family and friends how 
much we love them, let us 
remember the One who 
loves us and will never leave 
us or forsake us. The follow-
ing hymn beautifully reminds 
us of His love: 
Could we with ink the ocean fill 
And were the skies of parch-

ment made 
Were every stalk on earth a 

quill 
And every man a scribe by 

trade. 
To write the love of God above 
Would drain the ocean dry 
Nor could the scroll contain the 

whole 
Though stretched from sky to 

 

LOG IN TO 

www.clearbrook-nj.com 

 

By Brenda A. Carpio 

February is indeed a 
month when reminders of 
love are all around us. Hall-
mark sure will not let us for-
get. We are reminded to love 
one another and, we are re-
minded to love our country. 
Yes, we are reminded to ap-
preciate and honor those 
who fiercely loved our coun-
try and its people and tried to 
make our nation better. 

But sometimes we forget 
to remember that He, our 
loving God, will never pass 
away or will never stop loving 
us. No matter what, God will 
always love us. No matter 
how many times we mess 
up, sin, or fall away from 
Him, the love of Jesus is 
never ending and unfailing. 
John 3:16 reminds us that 
“God so loved the world that 
He gave His only begotten 
son to die for us …. Whoever 
believes in Him shall not per-
ish but have everlasting life”. 
He will continue to love us 

Christian Fellowship 

By Michael Katz 

A message for the New 
Year. May your Tzoris be few 
(problems) and your Nachas 
be plenty (good things). I 
know its February, but I 
would still like to wrap up the 
2022 year for the J.C.C. The 
congregation had a very 
strong year. We hired a won-
derful new Cantor, Ron 
Sucher. Our membership 
increased nicely, our holiday 
and Friday night services 
were well attended. All this 
could not have happened 
without help from our mem-

bers. 
We also have to give a 

special thanks to our Board 
of Directors, to Beverly 
Eskra, CCA President, and 
Krystal and Susan, the Life-
style ladies. Thank you as 
well to all the people who set 
up our event locations. With-
out you there would be no 
us. 

We will be shortly sending 
out information for our Tree 
of Life and our Memorial 
Tree. Please be on the look-
out for information. 

For anyone who would like 

sky. 
O love of God, how rich and 

pure! 
How measureless and strong! 
It shall forevermore endure 
The saints’ and angels’ song. 

We look forward to seeing 
you on the third Friday of 
each month until June. 
Whether you are an old timer 
here in Clearbrook or have 
recently moved into our com-
munity, please join us. A warm 
welcome will be yours. Our 
February meeting will be 
held on February 17 at 1 pm 
in Lounge A & B in the Club-
house. Bring your own sand-
wich or salad. Coffee, tea, and 
cookies will be served. Any 
questions? Call: 609-235-
9950, leave a message, and 
we will get back to you ASAP. 

to contact the J.C.C. team, 
please email us at JCong-
Clearbrook@gmail.com or 
call Michael Katz, president 
at 609-619-3762, Naomi Le-
fkowitz, treasurer, Barbara 
Wellen or Debbie Blen-
dowski, membership. 

Our Friday night service for 
February will be on February 
17 at 7:30 p.m. in the Cul-
tural Center. 

Most Important! On Febru-
ary 25, Bernice Miller will 
turn 100 years young. Best 
wishes from all of us for a 
happy, happy birthday. 

Jewish Congregation Highlights 

Referendum Presentation Scheduled 

by League of Women Voters 

By Linda Bozowski 

A presentation on the upcoming school construction refer-
endum has been scheduled by the League of Women Voters 
for Monday, February 27.  The information, to be presented 
by school officials, will be held at the Municipal Building court-
room at 1 pm. 

The actual vote is scheduled for Tuesday, March 14.  The 
Middlesex County Board of Elections will coordinate voting 
and will announce polling places and vote-by-mail proce-
dures.  Originally planned for an April election, the Board of 
Education was advised that the date needed to be moved 
forward one month or be delayed to September. 

The referendum proposes additions to both the middle and 
high schools and a large addition and renovation to Apple-
garth School, currently an elementary facility. The Applegarth 
building was constructed in 1936 but has had minimal renova-
tions over the past ninety years. There is concern that the 
infrastructure may require repairs that have not been fully an-
ticipated. 

The projected cost of the referendum is $103 million.  It is 
expected that property taxes will increase about $215 per 
year based on the average home value of $331,000 in the 
township. 

The public is urged to attend this presentation or another 
before the election date in March.  The meeting is open to the 
public.  League membership is not required to attend.  Sup-
porting our students in safer facilities should be a priority for 
all residents.  Detailed information will also be available on 
the Board of Education website. 

The Monroe Township Police Department would like to ad-
vise our residents about a new type of scam that is affecting 
our community. 

Recently, the Monroe Township Police Department has 
been receiving reports about a new phone scam. 

Some of our residents are advising that they are receiving 
phone calls from different 1-800 numbers from individuals that 
are claiming to be a representative from Xfinity. The scam-
mers then advise our residents that their service price is in-
creasing and they are running a onetime “promotional” pack-
age. They then advise that if they pay today their service will 
not be interrupted. In another situation the scammers say the 

(Continued on page 9) 

Scam Alert from the MT Police 
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Section 2 is looking for 
new Board members. Al-
though elections will not be 
held until May, the Board is, 
and will continue to be ac-
tively seeking anyone who 
would like to dedicate their 
time and talent to consider 
being a candidate for a seat 
on the Board. 

The next Open Board 
Meeting will be held at the 
Clubhouse on March 21 at 7 
p.m. in the Multi-Purpose 
room. 

Small deeds DONE are 
better than great deeds 
PLANNED – Peter Marshall 

 

Section 3 

Chatham Gardens 
By Patricia Feeney, Presi-

dent 

Here we are in February 
and so far so good. Things 

have been quiet in the Sec-
tion and we haven't had any 
snow as yet at the time of 
this writing in mid January. 
The snowbirds are in one of 
the warmer states and their 
temperatures are cooler than 
normal. Go figure!! Regard-
less of the weather, just re-
member to have your pre-
scriptions current, extra bot-
tles of water on hand, and a 
flashlight with extra batteries 
for emergencies with possi-
ble power outages. 

For 2023, I would like to 
list the dates for Open 
Meetings and they will be 
every other month this year. 
If there is a need for one on 
an off month, you will re-
ceive a robo call. All of the 
Open Meetings are held at 
the Clubhouse, Lounge B, 
on Thursdays at 2:30 pm. 
The Board hopes to see 

Section 2 

By Barbara J. Turner 

It is hard to believe that we 
are already into the second 
month of a new year. 

There are several days 
which are celebrated during 
the month of February, in-
cluding Groundhog Day, 
President’s Day and Valen-
tine’s Day. Also, the entire 
month of February has been 
designated as Heart Health 
Month. On February 11, the 
Activities Department will be 
sponsoring a dance dedi-
cated to heart health. Tickets 
for the dance are $5 each 
and can be purchased from 
the Activities Department. All 
are welcome to come out 
and enjoy the festivities. 

Please be reminded that 
each of our homes is con-
nected to someone else’s 
home. As such, we must 
keep in mind that things we 
do in our home may affect 
the person and/or person’s 
home connected to us. 
Please be mindful of items 
placed in the toilet that may 
cause the system to back up. 
If you have a garbage dis-
posal, please remember that 
only food remnants are to be 
disposed of and taking care 
not to force too much food at 
once which may cause a 
malfunction to occur. 

It has also come to the 
attention of the Board that 
there are still a few homes 
where hoses have not been 
disconnected from their bib-
cocks (spigot). Although we 
have had a few unseasona-
bly warm days, we must 
keep in mind that it is still 
winter. If the temperature 
drops, any hoses that are still 
connected may freeze and 
possibly cause damage re-
quiring expensive repair or 
replacement. Any repair or 
replacement required be-
cause hoses have not been 
removed will be the sole re-
sponsibility of the home-
owner. 

 

resident qualified for a 
$50.00 discount on their 
monthly bill, if they made a 
payment of $150.00 today. In 
these type of situations the 
scammers are attempting to 
get your credit card number 
without giving you time to 
think. 

The Monroe Township Po-
lice Department would like to 
take this opportunity to re-
mind our residents about 
scam phone calls and to not 
give any personal informa-
tion out over the phone. It is 
unfortunate, but some of our 
residents did fall victim to 
these scams. 

Please share this informa-
tion with family and friends 
as well as our senior citizens, 
because it appears that this 
is the population they are 
currently targeting the most. 
Let’s work together and not 
fall victim to these criminals! 

(Continued from page 8) 

Scam Alert  

more residents attending. 
March 16, May 18, July 20, 
September 21, and Novem-
ber 16. 

Executive Board Meeting 
dates to be determined. 

As a reminder, please do 
not flush “flushable” wipes 
with having 50-year-old 
pipes. They become pitted 
inside and the wipes attach 
themselves which then can 
cause a clog. 

The holidays in February 
include Ground Hog Day 
(2nd), Valentine’s Day (14th), 
Presidents Day (17). Febru-
ary is also American Heart 
Month since heart disease is 
the leading cause of death in 
both men and women. Two 
easy changes that are so 
beneficial for everyone are 1) 
put down the salt shaker, 
and 2) add more physical 
activity to your day. 

Looking forward to seeing 
more neighbors at our first 
2023 Open Meeting on 
Thursday, March 16 at 2:30 
pm in Lounge B. Stay 
healthy, safe and warm!!! 

 

Section 4 

By Irene Belinsky 

Even though it’s already 
February, we can still experi-
ence heavy snow and freez-
ing temperatures. It’s best to 
be prepared. 

Please be aware of where 
your main water shut-off 
valve is outside your home. It 
should not be covered by 
anything and easily accessi-
ble. In freezing temperatures, 
such as we experienced in 
December, pipes can freeze. 
All hoses and sprinklers 
should have already been 
disconnected. 

If you are leaving for any 
extended period, shut off the 
water and winterize the 
house. Leave all faucets 
open to allow for ice expan-
sion. Keep thermostats set to 
55 degrees. 

During severe storms, we 
may experience power out-
ages. Again, it pays to be 
prepared with batteries, 
charged phones, prescrip-

(Continued on page 10) 
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over the area. Problems 
have risen and must be tack-
led now. 

In February, some resi-
dents will be thinking about 
home improvements. Please 
check with the office or board 
before any work is to be 
started. A new state law for 
builders and fixer-uppers 
states that their name, ad-
dress, and license number 
must be shown on the truck 
(door or side). These compa-
nies without this info are con-
sidered unqualified. Either 
they have no license or in-
surance to cover any acci-
dents. If you or your neighbor 
have any damage, the board 
or CCA is not responsible. 
The office is trying to curtail 
those who are unqualified. 
The board has the right to 
enter a unit if we feel some-
thing is wrong or we are not 
informed of any work being 
done on a unit. 

No meetings are sched-
uled for February. Our next 
meeting is Tuesday March 
21 in Lounge B at 6:30 pm. 
Hope to see all of our unit 
owners. 

Sweet thoughts to all cele-
brating a birthday or anniver-
sary in February. My sweetie 
is on Valentine's Day. 

Stay well, 
Fran & Cupid 

 

Section 6 

Hilltop Village 
By Bernice Fitzgerald 

Section 6 Co-President 

Hello Neighbors… 
We hope that you are all 

enjoying this relatively mild 
winter thus far! 

The Board would like to 
welcome Lisa Gessert as our 
new Recording Secretary. 
We thank Lisa for stepping 
up and volunteering her time 
to help with our Section. We 
know Lisa brings a great deal 
to the table! 

The Board would also like 
to thank Joe Mazzola for his 
continued assistance with 
our siding project. Although 
Joe is not on the Board, he 
has continued to provide his 
expertise with this project. It 
is help from residents like 
Joe and Lisa who volunteer 
their time for the benefit of all 
Section 6 residents that 
makes our Section great! 

We have completed three 
buildings in our siding project 
so far – a double, triple and a 
quad. This equates to nine 
individual units. We have 
slated 13 buildings to be 
completed in 2023! The or-
der of the buildings being 
sided has been solely deter-
mined by a lottery system. 
Every building was put into a 
jar and drawn by a non-
board member. The buildings 
slated for 2023 are: 
162A, B, C Kalmia 
164A, B, C Kalmia 
167A, B, C Laurel 
178A, B Mimosa 
179A, B, C Mimosa 
190A, B Newport 
191A, B, C, D Newport 
193A, B, C Newport 
197A Newport 
199A Newport 
203A Newport 
173A, B, C, D Warren 
174A, B, C Warren 

The above is not the order 

(Continued on page 12) 

tions, and food. Also check 
on any elderly neighbors who 
are living alone to make sure 
they’re OK. 

We’d like to bring to your 
attention the JCP&L web site 
for a variety of savings avail-
able to you. This is some-
thing we should all take ad-
vantage of as our homes are 
completely electric. https://
www.firstenergycorp.com/
save_energy/save_energy_ 
new_jersey.html. Choose 
“For the Home” where you 
will find appliance rebates 
($200-400+) per appliance, 
Appliance Recycling, Energy 
Efficiency Kits, a Home En-
ergy Analyzer, and many 
other programs. Also, if you 
register with your account 
number, JCP&L will send 
you a package of free light 
bulbs and a surge protector. 
We can always use these. 

Before you know it, spring 
will be with us. Your Board of 
Directors is starting to get 
ready for it. We’ll be doing a 
walkthrough of the entire 
Section in early March to 
review and examine all our 
homes for roofs, driveways, 
gutters, etc. to see what work 
needs to be done going for-
ward. 

Trash – another reminder 
– we have placed white lat-
tice borders around the Com-
cast cable boxes in most of 
our Section to make them 
more esthetically pleasing. 
These are NOT trash recep-
tacles and why anyone 

(Continued from page 9) 

would think that and dispose 
of trash there is truly as-
tounding – in particular bags 
of dog poop. This brings us 
to another sore point which 
has generated many com-
plaints from all residents 
throughout the community. 
Dog owners who walk their 
dogs and DO NOT pick up 
after their dogs are telling all 
their neighbors that they do 
not respect them. And this is 
just plain nasty. It’s surpris-
ing we have residents who 
do this, but sadly we do. 

Also keep in mind the trash 
bins for the apartment build-
ings are strictly for use by 
those building residents, not 
the neighbors. Neighboring 
homes need to put their trash 
curbside on Wednesday 
mornings. Bulk items can be 
picked up by the Monroe Re-
cycling Center by appoint-
ment. 

We currently have one 
opening for a Director on our 
Board. If you would be inter-
ested in being a Board mem-
ber, please email belinsky-
irene@gmail.com. Some 
main responsibilities would 
include: monitoring our work-
order number once a week, 
voting on expenditures and/
or actions to be taken, plan-
ning special Section events, 
reviewing and deciding budg-
ets, meeting once a month 
for the Board and once every 
other month for our open 
Section board meeting. 

Our “Open” Board Meet-
ings for Section 4 this year 
will be as follows. All meet-
ings will begin at 7 pm in 
Lounge A in the Clubhouse. 
We hope to see all of you 
there: March 23, May 25, 
July 27, September 28, No-
vember 30. 

And sadly, we want to ex-
press our deep condolences 
to friends and family for the 
passing of one of our long-
time residents, Martin 
Mandel of Corylus who 
passed away at the end of 
December. Marty was at one 
time President of the Section 
4 Board of Directors and 
contributed greatly to our 
community for several years. 
He will be missed. 

 

Section 5 

By Fran Hecht, President 

February is a month of 
hearts. Some are big red 
velvet ones from Godiva, 
others are the important 
ones inside of us. They have 
been broken, fixed, or re-
placed. Let's take care of 
them and easy on the 
Godiva. 

We had our first open Sec-
tion meeting on January 17. 
Our board is working on big 
problems that have arisen 
over the years. The cul-de-
sacs are being put on hold 
due to the big trucks running 
over the edges of the bricks. 
The board is looking into gut-
ter guards. There is a lot in-
volved with this decision. 

I sat in on our Presidents’ 
Council meeting. They talked 
about main shut/off valves. 
The rule is a 2 foot square 
around the main valve must 
be clear to access in case of 
a problem. The Section 
needs to mark off every unit 
so we can install a hood box 

Section 4 

 

PRESIDENTS DAY 

FEBRUARY 20 
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Clearbrook 

Grocery Bus 

The grocery bus runs on 

Thursdays. Pickups start at 

9:30 am and go throughout 

the community. To reserve 

your seat, you must call the 

Activities Department. NO 

LATER THAN 2pm the day 

prior to the day you want to go.  
     609-655-5760 

Please look for eblasts re-

garding activities the Activi-

ties Department is putting on. 

Also, Channel 26 and the 

Clearbrook Website continue 

to be a great resource for 

information to keep you up to 

date. 

Krystal Graves , Lifestyle Director  Susan Schovanec, Lifestyle Assistant 

Lifestyle Department Hours: 9-5pm — 609-655-5760 

All events are subject to change. 

Community 

Information 
Health Care Center Open  
24 Hours, 7 days a week 

 

Phone Numbers  

To Know 
 

Administration  9 a.m. - 5 p.m.  655-2706 

Lifestyle Dept. 9 a.m. - 5 p.m.  655-5760 

Health Care Center  24 Hours  655-5888 

Maintenance  8 a.m. - 4:30 p.m.  655-5890 

Main Gate  24 Hours  655-5891 

   

   

CCA Open Board Meetings 

for 2023 

All Open Board Meetings are at 700 p.m. 
Wednesday, January 25 Clubhouse Ballroom 
Wednesday, February 22 Clubhouse Ballroom 
Wednesday, March 29 Clubhouse Ballroom 
Wednesday, April 26 Clubhouse Ballroom 
Wednesday, May 24 Clubhouse Ballroom 
Wednesday, June 28 Clubhouse Ballroom 
Wednesday, July 26 Clubhouse Ballroom 
Monday, August 7         Annual Meeting 

 (Election Day) 
Wednesday, August 23 Clubhouse Ballroom 
Wednesday, September 27 Clubhouse Ballroom 
Wednesday, October 25 Clubhouse Ballroom 
Wednesday, November 15 Clubhouse Ballroom 
No Meeting in December 
 

Work Sessions take place the second Tuesday of the 
month. All meetings are subject to cancellation.  
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FOR ADVERTISING CALL: 

Princeton Editorial Services 
732-761-8534 or 8535 

pescmd@aol.com 

used in the past. Anytime 
Plumbing in Jamesburg, 
732 390 9955 or 732 238 
8788, Redline Plumbing, 
732 616 7260 or Plumbing 
Solutions, 609 490 9774. 

If, and only if, the plumber 
is unable to clear the prob-
lem, then you may call the 
Board. 

Please remember to put 
your cars in the garage if the 
forecast is snow. The snow 
removal vendor will not clear 
your driveways if the car(s) 
are parked in the driveway. 
Also, remember that the 
CCA provides calcium chlo-
ride pellets that you can pick 
up from either the Admin 
building parking lot or the 
Cultural Center parking lot to 
protect your driveways from 
icing. Please do not use so-
dium chloride, because it 
invalidates our driveway war-
ranties. 

When walking your dogs, 
please remember to pick up 
after them, especially in the 
common areas. Additionally, 
when you see garbage in the 
streets, please take the time 
to pick it up and place it in a 
garbage can. Let's keep our 
streets and neighborhood 
clean! 

Have a happy, healthy and 
prosperous new year! 

Respectfully submitted, 
Melody Henry, President 

Hampton Village  
Section 8 

Please take a moment to 
review all Clearbrook and 
Section 8 Rules and Regula-
tions, so you are an 
"informed" resident! 

Best Wishes to all cele-
brating birthdays and anni-
versaries this month. 

Keep love in your heart 
and "Celebrate Everything!" 

HAPPY VALENTINE’S 
DAY! 

 

Section 9 

Kensington Village 
By Marie Service 

Happy February everyone! 
Now that all the holiday fes-
tivities have passed, I’m hop-
ing to spend some time to 
think about taking on new 
hobbies or planning trips and 
outings this spring, hoping 
our weather will cooperate 
with us. 

There are many events 
and activities here at Clear-
brook going on as per our 
calendar in The Courier, 
VOC channel 26, and in our 
emails. However, I don’t 
have much Section news this 
month to report. 

Our holidays this month: 
February 1 is the first day of 
Black History month 
 February 2 is Ground Hog 

Day 
 February 14 is Valentine’s 

Day 
 February 20 is Presidents 

Day 
 February 21 is Ladies of 

Section 9 luncheon 
 February 22 is Ash 

Wednesday 
Please “save the date” 

March 21 for the Ladies 
luncheon and the 23rd for 
the Section meeting. More 
details in next month’s issue. 

Good wishes to all who 
celebrate their birthdays and 
anniversaries this month. 

 

having any work done to 
your units, please be sure 
to inform the Section 8 
Board and the CCA Admini-
stration, in writing with the 
required forms, plans and 
permits before start of any 
work. Also, if there is a 
need to use dumpsters, DO 
NOT have any put on the 
driveways before informing 
and having an inspection 
done with the Section 
Board representative. 

Maintenance Requests 
If you have maintenance 

requests, please fill out a 
Section 8 - Work Assign-
ment Sheet. Unless it is an 
emergency, please do not 
call because we do not 
want verbal requests. We 
use the Work Assignment 
Sheet as an audit trail. 
These forms are now lo-
cated in the file room of the 
Administration Building - on 
the right hand side in the 
center cubby. They can 
also be returned to the 
same location. The form is 
also available on the Clear-
brook-NJ.com website. You 
need to LOG-IN, (if you 
don’t have your password 
information, log on and fol-
low the prompts ). Then go 
to CONTACTS. Once there, 
go to SECTION 8, then 
scroll down until you see 
the RED BUTTON. Click on 
this button to view and print 
the Work Assignment 
Sheet. 

 (I put this in every month, 
for our new residents or just 
in case you misplace the di-
rections to access.) 

Note from CCA Administra-
tion Office: 

For those of you who are 
leaving the community for an 
extended period during the 
winter season, please com-
plete the Winter Residence 
Form. It’s published in the 
Courier, available at the Ad-
ministration office and is on 
the website portal as an e-
form. 

Please complete the form 
online or return it to the Ad-
ministration Office before 
your departure. This informa-
tion is required in order for 
you to receive the Section 
Election Call for Candidates, 
to calculate occupancy for 
Monroe Township and most 
importantly, for the office to 
have in case of emergency. 

*** 
Get Well Wishes to Anne 

Fedor who we hope is on the 
road to recovery! 

Welcome to  
New Residents 

Grace Nkwodimmah of 274C 
Convent Rd. 
Joan Hoppel of 276A Con-
vent Rd. 
Keith and Deborah Hoffman 
of 298B Yardley Dr. 

Notes from 
 the President 

With the cold weather 
many folks have plumbing 
issues. If your bathrooms 
are backing up or not drain-
ing or you have no heat/hot 
water, etc, do not call the 
Board members. Here is 
the process for anyone ex-
periencing plumbing / hot 
water heating issues within 
their unit. Call a plumber. 
Below are three names of 
plumbers the Section has 

in which the buildings will be 
sided. That will be deter-
mined by the siding contrac-
tor. 

Please be advised that 
under no circumstances 
should anything be nailed to 
the siding. If someone nails 
anything to the siding, the 
Section will issue fines and 
the unit owner will be respon-
sible for the cost of the repair 
and/or replacement of the 
damaged siding. This is an 
extremely expensive project, 
and every unit owner holds 
responsibility to ensure the 
siding is not damaged. 

Additionally, if any unit has 
trees and/or oversized 
bushes within their three-foot 
bed that could impede the 
installation of the siding, they 
will be required to have these 
removed at their expense. If 
the unit owner fails to do this, 
either the Section will have it 
removed and the cost levied 
onto the unit, or the building 
will be skipped and the next 
building in line will be done. 

The Board cannot express 
enough the importance of 
using safety when walking. 
We have had several close 
calls. Wear reflective clothing 
and carry a light. 

We would like to welcome 
all our new residents to Sec-
tion 6! Please follow any im-
portant updates on Channel 
26 and we hope to see you 
when our open meetings re-
sume in April! 

The Section has estab-
lished a Hot Line number for 
all residents to call. NO ONE 
SHOULD BE CALLING A 
BOARD MEMBERS CELL 
PHONE DIRECTLY. Please 
use the Hot Line number – 
732-573-8473. Board mem-
bers will no longer be an-
swering their cell phones for 
residential calls. 

Stay warm and safe! 
 

Section 8 

Hampton Village 
By Liz Strazza 

Vice-President 

Welcome to February 
2023! Good things happen-
ing… 

The Section 8 Holiday 
Party was a huge success 
despite last minute dropouts 
due to the inclement weather 
and an increase in the flu 
and colds. Scotto's served a 
delicious four-course meal 
and the Board provided ex-
cellent desserts. There were 
holiday raffles and spirits and 
everyone enjoyed them-
se l v es .  F r i ends and 
neighbors were happy to 
share in the festivities. You 
are all encouraged to make 
this community more inclu-
sive by joining in the fun. 

There are four General 
Section Meetings every 
year and we encourage all 
residents to attend. Below 
are the dates, so please 
mark your calendars. All are 
held from 7 to 9 pm in 
Lounge B. 
Wednesday, March 15 
Wednesday, June 14 
Wednesday, September 20 
Wednesday, November 15 

Home Improvements 
If you are planning on 

Section 6 
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Section 12 

By Jerry Sperling 

Hi Section Twelvers, Jerry 
here with so little space and 
so much to say! Let's start off 
with this: Some dog walkers 
are at it again! I keep seeing 
those 12-foot, retractable 
leashes on your pets, and 
you are only allowed a 6-foot 
leash. Come on, let's obey 
Clearbrook's rules and regu-
lations! 

The snow plows and shov-
elers are not required to do 
your driveways or walkways 
unless there is more than 
two inches of snow on the 
ground. Keep ice melt on 
hand in case of a little snow. 
Also snow melt is available 
at the Clubhouse and Cul-
tural Center. 

If you plan on having any 
work done on your unit 
please contact this Section 
board and administration to 
fill out the proper paperwork. 
Dumpster requests need to 
be approved by the Section 
board and are allowed for 
two weeks. if needed longer 
than two weeks it must be 
approved by this board. 

We need volunteers to 
help us, if you would like to 
volunteer, please contact 
Beverly Eskra at 908-208-
4851 or Rosemarie Stup-
piello at 732-207-4127. The 
next Section 12 Open Board 
Meeting will be held on Mon-
day, February 6 at 7 p.m. in 
Lounge A in the clubhouse, 
hope to see you there! 

Flash, our own Roland 

FOR EVERYONE’S 

SAFETY,  

NO SPEEDING IN 

THE COMMUNITY 

Jopling bowled a perfect 300 
game in a No Tap Bowling 
competition last December at 
Knob Hill Alleys! Way to go, 
Roland! 

Section Twelvers, for the 
New Year please stay safe, 
mask up when out and about 
because Covid, the flu and 
RSV are highly contagious. 
Have a very Happy Valen-
tine’s Day, Jerry! 

 

Section 14 

Oxford Village 
By Grace Makuch 

Clearbrooksection14 

@gmail.com 

Welcome new Section 
residents. If you have any 
questions you can email to 
the above email address to... 
Grace Makuch who will be 
happy to assist you. If you 
are on Facebook Clearbrook 
residents have  their own 
site. It’s under Residents of 
Clearbrook Face Book Page. 
This is a great site that will 
be helpful to you. On Clear-
brook’s official web site, 
www.clearbrook-nj.com you 
can learn many things like 
who is on your street and 
events that are happening 
and more. 

Happy Valentine’s Day to 
all Clearbrook residents. 
Clearbrook is a community 
where people come to enjoy 
life. We have so many 
events and things to do. Feb-
ruary is a time to reflect on 
LOVE and CARING. I have 
noticed so many residents 
assisting neighbors in need, 

like taking out and in the gar-
bage bins, or calling them if 
they are not well. Many resi-
dents have been living in this 
Section 30 years or more. As 
we grow older we all want to 
do things for ourselves, but 
sometimes I notice when I'm 
not feeling well it's nice to 
know I have people I can call 
to be there for me. 

We all want to be inde-
pendent, that’s a good thing. 
It’s not easy to feel that way 
if we are feeling under the 
weather. It’s ok to ask for 
assistance. When you feel 
like you’re coming down with 
a cold or ill, contact a family 
member or friend, so they 
can call you to make sure 
you are feeling ok each day. 
If they live close they may 
want to come and bring their 
famous chicken soup. Let the 
nurse know if you are very 
sick, she can call for help if 
needed. Let your neighbors 
know you’re not well. Let 
them know where you keep 
your emergency phone num-
bers. Keep a list of your pri-
mary doctor handy and the 
hospital of your choice. You 
may be thinking, you don’t 
want to bother them they 
have issues of their own. In 
an emergency they can get 
to you the fastest. Everyone 
wants to help a neighbor. 

If you are planning to 
adopt a pet, review your age 
and the age of the pet you 
want to adopt. Example a cat 
can live 20-plus years. If you 
are 70-plus will the cat out 

(Continued on page 14) 



FEBRUARY 2023 — PAGE 14  

 

The Clearbrook CourierThe Clearbrook Courier  

they can't wait to drive to a 
special vacation place. So 
when we reach 80 we see 
nothing wrong in getting in 
the car and going to the 
store, doctors office, etc. No 
one wants to ask friends and 
family for help. Everyone is 
busy with their own lives, 
working, taking care of the 
family, etc. So what is a sen-
ior to do? There is help out 
there, talk to neighbors, 
friends, family and your Sen-
ior Center. Let them know 
what your needs and con-
cerns are. What type of help 
you need to live on your own, 
but without a car. Not being 
able to drive for a variety of 
reasons does not change the 
person you are. When a per-
son drives when they are 
tired, not feeling well, it can 
cause an accident. You don't 
want to hurt yourself or any-
one else. 

 

Section 15 

Pickwick Village 
By Sandra Stark 

“Do something today that 
your future self will thank you 
for.” Sean Patrick Flanery 

“Do things for people not 
because of who they are, or 
what they do in return, but 
because of who you are.” 
Harold S. Kushner 

Each monthly column al-
lows this author to research 
quotes of  af f irmation, 
neighborly love and grati-
tude. These two seemed pre-
scient for this upcoming Val-
entine’s Day. 

IMPORTANT: Residents/ 
Owners Meeting 

Thursday, February 9 at 7 
pm in the Clubhouse Multi-
Purpose Room. 

OPERATIONS 
Vinyl Fencing: Repairs to 

the gate of the 538 Berberis 
Plaza and post of 542/543 
Berberis Plaza dumpster en-
closures have been com-
pleted. The fence dividing 
the patio areas between 
545A&C Ardmore Road has 
been reset. Proper mainte-
nance of all vinyl fences is 
imperative. If you see an is-
sue, please notify the Sec-
tion president. 

Drainage: Flooding and 
drainage is a common prob-

Section 14 
lem throughout the entirety of 
Clearbrook. The Section 15 
Board of Directors is well 
aware of a few serious is-
sues and is working toward 
resolutions. The pooling of 
water on side, front or back 
yards is low priority. Our ma-
jor concerns involve im-
proper drainage that impacts 
parking lot and street areas 
which may cause ice accu-
mulation. REMINDER: Be 
careful in all parking areas, 
sidewalks and driveways this 
winter season. Be sure to 
bring a container with you to 
pick up salt from the bins 
located at the Cultural Center 
or Clubhouse. 

Landscape Committee: 
We’re anxiously waiting for 
spring! 

CAPITAL IMPROVEMENTS 
Vinyl Siding: The Board is 

currently compiling estimates 
for vinyl siding. We have a 
total of 20 buildings, and one 
has been completed. The 
siding program is expected 
to take a number of years. 

Concrete: In 2022 the 
Board arranged for the re-
placement of eight driveways 
and dangerous or damaged 
sidewalks. An evaluation for 
concrete work to be done in 
2023 will be completed by 
mid-summer. 

Please note the contact 
information for the Section 
President: Sandra Stark at 
908-938-0798 or by email: 

starkc21@aol.com 
Happy Valentine’s Day! 
 

Section 16 

By Maria Petro 

Happy February to all Sec-
tion 16 residents. 

The Board would like to 
remind everyone that we live 
in a condo association and 
there are rules to follow. We 
may not all agree with or like 
them but they are there for 
the general wellbeing of all 
who live here. Below are 
some gentle reminders; 
 All garbage cans must be 

kept in the garage unless 
at the curb for pick up 

 The dumpsters are for the 
residents of the Devon and 
Cambridge units only! 

 Overnight street parking is 
prohibited. Your car may 
be towed. 

 Please pick up after your 
dog. 

 When parking on the 
street, do not block the 
mailboxes. The postman 
will not deliver the mail if 
he cannot access the 
boxes. 
With winter upon us, 

please check the website or 
the Courier for snow removal 
procedures. Driveways will 
not be cleared if you leave 
your car there. You can 
move it to the Cultural center 
parking lot before the snow 
arrives. 

January was a relatively 
quiet month with not much 
going on. There weren’t any 
major issues. 

Our POT LUCK DINNER is 
scheduled for Sunday Febru-
ary 19. It will be in the Club-
house Lounges A&B. You 
should have received the 
flyer in your mailbox by now. 
You can bring any type of 
dish you desire but you must 

(Continued on page 15) 

live you? 
A dog’s average is 13 plus 

and the same goes here. 
Think of your age and the 
pet’s age, I’m sure you don’t 
want to have your loving pet 
have to find a new home af-
ter you are gone. 

Living in any retirement 
development is different than 
owning your own home in a 
city. When you buy a home 
in a city you own some of the 
surrounding property. In a 
retirement development you 
only own the inside of your 
residence. The property be-
longs to the development. 
Clearbrook is getting an av-
erage of seven or more new 
residents a month. Many ask 
about making changes in 
their property area. You can 
make changes in your 3-foot 
area. You may plant pre ap-
proved bushes, check with 
your Section board for the 
list. If you have questions of 
any kind, each Section has 
its own board of volunteer, 
friendly Section residents to 
help with your Section 
budget, finances, rules, etc. 
Each Section has different 
rules and regulations be-
cause the sections were not 
all built at the same time. If 
you plan to get a dog, check 
to see how many your Sec-
tion allows. 

Monroe has everything for 
seniors close to home. Medi-
cal building with a large vari-
ety of doctors in one building. 
A few radiology groups in a 
short driving distance. A few 
pharmacies to choose from. 
Monroe has a large variety of 
Senior Developments with 
many options of your choice, 
making this area one of the 
fastest growing towns. 

Monroe also has a high 
rate of car accidents with 
people over 80 years old. As 
we get older, our bodies may 
not be as healthy as before. 
Our minds get tired faster 
and the reflexes take longer. 
Every person wants to drive, 
teenagers can't wait to drive 
themselves to school. Adults 
drive every day to and from 
work. When people retire 

(Continued from page 13) 
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that states “Forms and Regu-
lations.” Here you will find all 
information including require-
ments for forms, applica-
tions, permits required from 
the township, etc. Our Sec-
tion Board can assist with 
submission of forms to en-
sure that you are compliant 
with rules. Any contractor 
performing work must be 
licensed and insured. In ad-
dition to unit modifications, 
the site provides landscap-
ing, street light outage and 
utility box forms. Like my dad 
always said, “Measure twice, 
cut once.” Rules can be frus-
trating sometimes, but their 
intent is to protect you and 
your home. 

Although days are getting 
a bit longer, please continue 
to wear light or reflective 
clothing while walking or bik-
ing in the community. Some 
of our activities have been 
moved indoors for the time 
being to enable us to take 
advantage of all Clearbrook 
has to offer. Check out the 
calendar of events at the end 
of this publication as well as 
our local library and Senior 
Center on Applegarth Road. 

Have a safe and wonderful 
February. Wishing you lots of 
love. March will be here be-
fore we know it! 

Contact List 
Unit issues 
Sharon Monchinski, 609 655 
3033 
D r y e r  V e n t s  M y r a 
D’Agostino, 609 619 3201 
Power Washing Josh Ja-
cobs, 646 606 4876 
Gutters Josh Jacobs, 646 
606 4876 
Grounds 
Bill Hamlin, 908 358 2253 
Josh Jacobs, 646 606 4876 
Trees 
Mike Shinkle, 609 655 8619 
Winterization 

(Continued on page 16) 

call one of the committee to 
let us know what it is. We will 
be keeping a list so we don’t 
have too many duplicates. 
This will be a fun way to get 
together for some food, fun 
and a way to meet new peo-
ple and catch up with old 
friends. Please call and join 
us for the afternoon! 
Feb 14. Valentine’s Day 
Feb 20, Presidents Day 
Feb 22. Ash Wednesday 

Have a great February and 
let’s look forward to spring! 

 

Section 17 

By Holly Ives 

Not that I am counting 
down (I am) but when you 
receive this issue, there will 
be only 48 days until spring! 
And did you know you can 
check the Courier on the 
CCA website? It is often 
available before the 1st of 
the month. 

It's a new year so it is time 
to mark your calendars. 

Our dates for Open Board 
meetings are :March 15, 
April 12, May 10, June 14, 
July 12, August 9, Septem-
ber 13, October 11, Novem-
ber 15. 

All are on Wednesdays 
from 2pm-4pm in the Confer-
ence room at the Clubhouse. 

Our dates for Section 17 
meetings are April 20, May 
18, September 21, October 
19 

All are on Thursdays from 
7pm-9pm in the Cultural 
Center. 

Section news: *Recently 
our board voted Patricia 
Czerwinski to fill a vacancy. 
Welcome, Pat! 

*Gutter cleaning has been 
completed. 

*The last 13 units for dryer 
vent cleaning will be sched-
uled. 

Please remember when 
you are having (1st time) 
guests or contractors visit: 

*Program '1 Clearbrook 
Plaza' into their GPS or they 
will end up at the gate near-
est your home. 

*Remind them of the 25 
mph speed limit throughout 

(Continued from page 14) 

the community and to stop at 
ALL stop signs. 

*Please do not park oppo-
site any driveways or in front 
of mailboxes. (Mailman will 
not deliver!) 

*There is no overnight 
parking on the street. (You 
can have your guest park in 
your driveway while YOU 
park overnight in the Cultural 
Center lot.) 

Holidays for February, 
which is American Heart and 
Black History month: 
Groundhog Day (2), National 
Women Physicians Day (3), 
National Pizza Day (9), Su-
per Bowl (12), Valentine's 
Day (14), Random Acts of 
Kindness Day (17), Presi-
dents Day and National Love 
Your Pet Day (20), Mardi 
Gras (21) and Ash Wednes-
day (22). (2024=Leap year) 

Happy Birthday to all born 
in February under the signs 
of Aquarius and Capricorn, 
especially Nancy and Bob 
Scheid. Anniversary wishes 
to those celebrating and get 
well wishes to all. 

Short month...short col-
umn! 

 

Section 18A 

Stuart Village 
By Marianne Ippolito 

Hello again, Section 18A 
friends and neighbors. As I 
write this month’s article I 
can say we have been fortu-
nate with regards to weather 
here in Central New Jersey. 
Our sunrises and sunsets 
have been spectacular. No 
snow to speak of and the 
amount of rain may ensure 
that our lawns are healthy 
and green come spring. 
Then again today is actually 
Friday the 13, so I hope I did 
not jinx us! 

Some of us have been 
spending a good deal of time 
at home and may be in the 
planning stages of home im-
provements. Before you take 
on projects, please go to the 
Clearbrook website and re-
view the various applications 
and requirements for specific 
work to be done in your 
home. Once you log onto the 
site, on the left hand side in 
blue you will find a Section 

Section 16 
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Myra D’Agostino  
609-619-3201 
Roofs Walkways Driveways 
and Drainage 
Joe Manzo, 732-900-6936 

 

Section 18B 

Tudor Village 
By Kay Neu 

I know this is the February 
Courier but can one month of 
2023 be history already? 
Hope all had a happy holi-
day. I think the decorations 
were especially beautiful this 
season. 

It is with sadness that I 
announce the passing of four 
residents, all actually resid-
ing on Azalea Plaza: Ansa 
Nadler, Jack Silver, Ella To-
pal and Joe Ghignone. 

February comes from the 
Latin “to cleanse”. Februalia 
was a Roman festival of puri-
fication and atonement which 
lasted one month. Wednes-
day, February 2 is Ground-
hog Day which is also the 
mid-point between the De-
cember winter solstice and 
the spring equinox in March. 
Valentine’s Day is Tuesday 
the 14th. February is African-

(Continued from page 15) 

American History month. 
I hope you had a chance to 

read President Andrew 
Cappa’s Holiday Letter, with 
a recap of work done in our 
Section: removing additional 
diseased trees, seeding and 
replanting in many areas. 
Along the fence by Pompton 
Road we planted trees and 
added additional other plants 
to improve the appearance. 
A 3-foot wall was rebuilt on 
Zinnia Plaza, a new fence 
built at the quads on Sewell 
and several damaged walk-
ways repaired. As we do 
each year, gutters were 
cleaned twice. 

Treasurer Bethel Sage 
included her 2022 financial 
report and an insurance form 
for new residents to verify 
coverage. As reported last 
month, Section 18B’s 2023 
total monthly maintenance is 
now $400. 

Section 18B Open Meet-
ings for 2023 are all Tues-
days and as follows: 
 March 21 
 May 16 (Pizza Party/

Election) 
 July 18 
 September 19 
 November 21 

With many temperatures in 
the sixties recently, I just 
wanted to include a last re-
minder to remove hoses from 
outdoor spigots, leave them 
open and shut off the water 
inside. Neglecting this, home 
owners will be responsible 
for pipes that freeze and 
crack. The January Courier 
again published an all-

inclusive article on snow pro-
cedures. The January Cou-
rier also published a form 
(Page 14) for individuals who 
plan to be away from the 
community this winter for any 
length of time. Please com-
plete and return to Admini-
stration, including information 
as to your winter address, 
emergency contact and tele-
phone number, and location 
of keys to your home. 

If you are planning any 
renovations to your unit, 
please submit a modifica-
tion request which can be 
found on the resident web-
page or from Administra-
tion, along with plans, per-
mits (if required) and li-
cense and insurance proof 
for contractor. If you will 
need a dumpster, please 
notify the Section. Also, if 
you hire a plumber, electri-
cian for small jobs, please 
make sure they carry insur-
ance and a license. Con-
tractors that do not do a 
proper job can cause you 
additional expense. 

JCP&L currently has a pro-
gram for rebates on Energy 
Star certified equipment such 
as dryers, washers, heat 
pumps, HVAC equipment. 
Complete details can be 
found online at JCP&L appli-
ance rebates, including the 
application and a list of par-
ticipating Energy Star deal-
ers. 

I can’t change the direction 
of the wind, but I can adjust 
my sails to always reach my 
destination. Jimmy Dean 

Section 18A 

Email The Courier:   

pescmd@aol.com 
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torical photographs of loca-
tions and buildings where 
schools for the colored stood 
within southern New Jersey, 
Pennsylvania, Ohio, Indiana, 
and Illinois. These images 
represent the architecture 
and geography of America’s 
educational apartheid as part 
of the African American ex-
perience in education. This 
program is part of a series of 
library events in honor of 
Black History Month. This is 
a virtual program. Registra-
tion is required. Register at 
the Welcome Desk, online at 
www.monroetwplibrary.org/
calendar or by phone at (732) 
521-5000. Please provide a 
valid email address to receive 
a Zoom link to the event. 

Scrabble Club 
Tuesday, February 14 at 

3:00 p.m. 
Come in and join us for 

s o m e  c a s u a l ,  n o n -
competitive, rounds of the 
timeless board game, Scrab-
ble. We will try to place at-
tendees around the same 
skill level (beginner, interme-
diate, expert) or based on 
average score. Feel free to 
bring your own board, or use 
one provided by the library. 
Registration is required. Reg-
ister at the Welcome Desk, 
online at www.monroetwp 
library.org/calendar or by 
phone at (732) 521-5000. 

Virtual Author Talk:  
Grace M. Cho 

Thursday, February 16 at 
1:00 p.m. 

Please join us for an in-
sightful chat with award-
winning author Grace M. Cho 
as she discusses her mem-
oir, “Tastes Like War”. Grace 
M. Cho grew up as the 
daughter of a white American 
merchant marine and the 
Korean bar hostess he met 
abroad. They were one of 
few immigrants in a xeno-
phobic small town during the 
Cold War, where identity was 
politicized by everyday de-
tails—language, cultural ref-
erences, memories, and 
food. This is a virtual pro-
gram. Registration is re-
quired. Register at the Wel-
come Desk, online at 
www.monroetwp library.org/
authortalks or by phone at 
(732) 521-5000. 

York and the 
 American Dream 

Friday, February 17 at 2:00 
p.m. 

This is a live performance 
by professional actor Marvin 
Jefferson. Mr. Jefferson por-
trays York, the enslaved per-
son of William Clark of the 
famous Lewis and Clark Ex-
pedition. York served as an 
“unofficial” member of the 
Corps of Discovery and was 
instrumental in the expedi-
tion’s eventual success. 
Come and hear his story. 
This program is held in per-
son. Registration is required. 
Register at the Reference 
Desk, online at www.monroe 
twplibrary.org/calendar or by 
phone at (732) 521-5000. 

Climate Change in  
New Jersey 

Saturday, February 18 at 
11:00 a.m. 

Citizens’ Climate Lobby 
will present the impact of 

climate change in New Jer-
sey, federal legislation to 
address climate change and 
opportunities for people to 
learn more and get involved. 
Sponsored by the Monroe 
Township Environmental 
Commission.  

This is a hybrid program. 
Join us via Zoom or in per-
son. Registration is re-
quired. Register at the Wel-
come Desk, online at 
www.monroe twplibrary.org/
calendar or by phone at 
(732) 521-5000. 

All Snowstorms: 
During all snowstorms the fol-

lowing snow clearance procedures 
will be followed. As per contract, 
during typical storms (15 inches or 
less), snow should be cleared from 
all driveways and walkways within 
24 hours after a snowfall con-
cludes. In the event of a larger 
snowstorm or blizzard conditions, 
clearance may take longer---at 
least 48 hours from the time the 
snowfall stops. Clearance of snow/
ice will not take place in the com-
munity unless the accumulation 
reaches more than two (2) inches.* 

* When snow and ice accumula-
tion is less than 2 inches, the Snow 
Contractor shall, upon authorization 
from Association’s management, 
commence with the tipping of drive-
ways (clearing of the snow/ice from 
the bottom of the driveways). 

Preparation Prior to an  
Upcoming Snowfall:  

The Association takes the follow-
ing steps in anticipation of severe 
weather conditions: 
1. The General Manager and the 

snow contractor’s Operations 
Manager are in constant commu-
nication with each other to deter-
mine the best time to call the 
snow contractor to send its crews 
to the Property.  

2. The General Manager makes 
a determination based on the 
type and amount of snow pre-
dicted and the current tem-
perature on whether or not to 
salt our roads.  

Staff/Equipment: 
The current CCA snow contractor 

has the following on site at the begin-
ning of a snowstorm: 
1. 40 to 50 laborers with shovels 

and snow blowers 
2. 8 to 10 pick-up/dump trucks with 

plows 
3. 12 to 15 front end loader type 

tractors for driveways 

Plowing of Roads: 
Once the snow reaches a depth of 

two inches, the plows begin to clear 
the snow from all the roads in Clear-
brook. This includes: 
1. Streets 
2. Cul-de-sacs 
3. Entry Roads (main, north and 

east gates) 
4. Maintenance Service Road 
5. Path in the Clubhouse Parking 

Lot 
6. Path in the Cultural Center Park-

ing Lot 

Snow Removal Procedure 
After the Snowfall Ceases: 

Once the snow stops, all roadways 
will be cleared 12” from the curb on 
each side of the road except where 
mailboxes, driveways, storm drains 
and fire hydrants are located. Drive-
way and walkway clearing will also 
begin when the snowfall stops.  

The community is divided into five 
areas, each area worked by a differ-
ent team for the snow clearing proc-
ess. Teams are rotated throughout 
the season to start in different sec-
tions. 

All snow is cleared from the fol-
lowing: 
1. All walkways at apartment com-

plexes, Devons, Cambridges and 
all sidewalks to individual units 
including the front door to the 
garage door across the atrium for 
Braeburns.  

2. All primary entrance walks at 
main entrance, Clubhouse and 
Cultural Center 

3. All driveways and parking lots 
throughout the community, in-
cluding the Clubhouse and Cul-
tural Center 

4. All dumpster areas, fire hydrants, 
mailboxes and storm drains 

5. All breakouts leading from side-
walks to roads 

Once all areas are completed, 
follow up will be performed as 
needed on missed or problem areas.  

There will be no special consid-
eration for working residents, resi-
dents leaving on a trip or residents 
with doctor’s appointments not 
deemed a medical emergency. 

** Driveways will not be cleared of 
snow if a vehicle is parked on the 
driveway. The only exception to this 
is if a driveway is shared by two own-
ers. We do ask that the owner with a 
vehicle on the driveway park as close 
to the opposite side of the driveway 
furthest away from the other owner’s 
side of the driveway. 

Medical Emergency  
Clearance: 

Our Contractor will be handling all 
snow clearing for medical emergen-
cies. The Health Care Center pre-
pares a listing of the medical emer-
gencies after verifying all appoint-
ments. Priorities for snow clearance 
for medical emergencies are only 
given to residents who have a verifi-
able appointment for one of the fol-
lowing: 
1. Dialysis 
2. Chemotherapy 
3. Radiation therapy 
4. Scheduled Surgery 
5. Home Health Aides for the Seri-

ously Disabled 
Consideration will also be given to 

Meals on Wheels, Visiting Nurses 
and Hospice Teams. 

Communications Protocol 
During the Storm: 

The protocol that Management will 
be following for all snow events is 
outlined below. Snow Clearance 
Procedures are also on the Clear-
brook Website. You can view it by 
going to: www.clearbrook-nj.com and 
logging in. Next, go to “Resources” 
on the main website menu and click 
on the “Documents and Forms” link. 
The snow clearance procedure is 
located under “Emergency Proce-
dures including Snow Procedures” 
link. 
 Once the snow stops, the snow 

contractor will communicate all 
Section plowing updates to Man-
agement. Upon receipt of the up-
dates, Management will send out 
an email blast, update the website 
and post the updates on the elec-
tronic bulletin board (Channel 26). 

These updates will also be com-
municated from Management to 
the VOC volunteers and broad-
casted every three hours on Chan-
nel 26 until the VOC goes off the 
air. 

 Management will continue to pro-
vide updates via email blast, the 
website and the electronic bulletin 
board every three hours until mid-
night, resuming the following morn-
ing.  

 Per the snow procedures, resi-
dents should not report driveways 
or walkways missed until the sec-
tion is complete. Once Manage-
ment and the VOC have reported 
the section being complete, any 
missed driveways or walkways 
should be reported directly to the 
Administration office at (609) 664-
5517. The missed driveway or 
walkway will then be communi-
cated directly to the snow contrac-
tor. In addition, all emails concern-
ing snow removal after a storm 
need to be directed to the following 
email address: snow@clearbrook-
nj.com. DO NOT CONTACT THE 
GATEHOUSE, NURSES’ OFFICE 
OR THE MAINTENANCE OFFICE. 
THE CLEARBROOK ADMIN OF-
FICE IS THE CENTRAL POINT 
OF CONTACT TO REPORT 
SNOW-RELATED ISSUES FOR 
SNOW OCCURRENCES DURING 
THE WEEK AND ON WEEK-
ENDS. 

 This process will be followed for 
snow events occurring Monday 
through Friday or over the week-
end. 

Advisory to Residents: 
1. Prior to a storm, make sure you 

have adequate supplies: food, 
batteries, medications and a good 
book. 

2. Residents should remain calm – 
your property will be plowed, and 
you will gain access from your 
home. 

3. Watch Channel 26 or the website 
for updates from the VOC volun-
teers after the snow stops. 

4. Do not report that your driveway 
or walkway was missed until the 
VOC reports that your area is 
completed. 

5. Do not call the nurses or the 
gatehouse for snow information; 
they do not have information on 
the location of the plows. Their 
phone lines must be kept open 
for emergencies only. 

6. Most important, be patient. Un-
derstand that during a snow-
storm, the people running the 
plows and shoveling are trying 
their best to get the job done as 
fast as they can, working through 
the night and under extremely 
cold conditions.  

7. For your safety, please do not 
stand behind any equipment as 
the operator cannot see or hear 
you. All snow-related resident 
communications should follow the 
protocol outlined above. 

8. If there is a real emergency – 
you must dial 911 –not the 
nurse or the gatehouse. 

Snow Clearance Procedures 

Coffee and a Book 
Tuesday, February 21 at 

11:00 a.m. 
Read and discuss “The 

Sweetness of Water: A 
Novel” by Nathan Harris, a 
profound debut about the 
unlikely bond between two 
freedmen who are brothers 
and the Georgia farmer 
whose alliance will alter their 
lives. Join us via Zoom or in 
person. Registration is re-
quired. Register at the Wel-
come Desk, online at 
www.monroetwplibrary.org/
calendar or by phone at 
(732) 521-5000. 

Boheme Opera NJ 
Performance: Madama 

Butterfly 
Wednesday, February 22 

at 1:00 p.m. 
Boheme Opera NJ visits 

Monroe Township Library 
with a lecture performance 
exploring the origin story be-
hind Puccini’s “Madama But-
terfly”. Sponsored by Monroe 
Township Cultural Arts Com-
mission, this performance 
lecture will focus on the ori-
gins and story behind one of 
Puccini’s most famous op-

(Continued on page 18) 

The Library’s hours are 
Monday through Thursday: 
9:30 a.m. until 9:00 p.m., 
Friday 9:30 a.m. to 5:00 
p.m., Saturday and Sunday 
10:00 a.m. to 5:00 p.m. 

at (732) 521-5000. 

Author Talk: Rich Polk 
Tuesday, February 7 at 

2:30 pm 
Rich Polk will discuss his 

latest book, “Burgess Falls”, 
a historical novel that takes 
place in Tennessee in the 
1800s. The author is a New 
Jersey resident. This pro-
gram is held in person. Reg-
istration is required. Register 
at the Welcome Desk, online 
at www.monroetwplibrary. 
org/calendar or by phone at 
(732) 521-5000. 

Caregiver Support Group 
Wednesday, February 8 at 

11:00 a.m. 
A Caregiver Support 

Group meets at the Library 
monthly on the second 
Wednesday of the month. 
Kat Verdi, Certified Alz-
heimer’s and Dementia Care 
Trainer, of The Gardens at 
Monroe leads the group. Her 
mission is to educate, em-
power and encourage care-
givers. All are welcome. This 
program is held in person. 
Registration is not required. 
Sponsored by The Gardens 
at Monroe. 

International Film 
Discussion 

Thursday, February 9 at 
2:30 p.m. 

Hosted by the Friends of 
the Monroe Township Li-
brary. The film for February 
9th is “Peace by Chocolate”, 
a Canadian film about a 
charming young Syrian refu-
gee caught between follow-
ing his dream and preserving 
his family’s legacy after the 
bombing of his father’s 
chocolate factory. 

Films are available to 
stream for free on Kanopy, 
accessible with your library 
card online at https://
monroetw.kanopy. com. The 
discussion is virtual and will 
be held via Zoom. Register 
at the Welcome Desk, online 
at www.monroetwplibrary. 
Org/calendar or by phone at 
(732) 521-5000 to receive 
the link to the Zoom meeting. 

Virtual Author Talk: 
 Lana Harper 

Thursday, February 9 at 
7:00 p.m. 

Join us for a magical eve-
ning with New York Times 
bestselling author Lana 
Harper as she discusses the 
enchanting third installment 
of her immensely popular 
The Witches of Thistle Grove 
series, “Back in a Spell”. This 
is a virtual program. Regis-
tration is required. Register 
at the Welcome Desk, online 
at www.monroetwplibrary. 
org/authortalks or by phone 
at (732) 521-5000. 

“Schools for the Colored” 
Historical Photographs 
Friday, February 10 at 2:00 

p.m. 
Join us for a lecture on 

Zoom with Wendel White, an 
award-winning photographer 
and distinguished professor 
of Art and American Studies 
at Stockton University. Pro-
fessor White will discuss his-

February at the Monroe Township Public Library 
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eras, Madama Butterfly. 
Highlights and excerpts will 
include Butterfly’s arias, “Un 
bel di”, “Che tua madre”, and 
others plus the flower duet 
with Suzuki, Pinkerton’s Act I 
aria, and others performed 
by three artists, a pianist, 
and narrator-lecturer. This 
program will be held in-
person at the Library. Regis-
tration is not required. 

Short Story  
Discussion Group 

Thursday, February 23 at 
2:00 p.m. 

We will discuss “The 
Farmer’s Children” by Eliza-
beth Bishop in The Best 
American Short Stories of 

(Continued from page 17) the Century edited by John 
Updike and “Sister Hills” in 
What We Talk About When 
We Talk Anne Frank by Na-
than Englander. This pro-
gram is held in-person at the 
Library. Registration is re-
quired. Register at the Wel-
come Desk, online at 
www.monroetwplibrary.org/
calendar or by phone at 
(732) 521-5000. 

All You Need is  
Love Book Club 

Friday, February 24 at 
11:00 a.m. 

Join our modern romance 
book group to discuss “The 
Sight of You” by Holly Miller. 
This is a hybrid program. 
Join us via Zoom or in per-
son. *Registration is required 
for in-person participation. 
Register to receive the Zoom 
link. 

Port Newark and the 
Origins of Container 

Shipping 
Saturday, February 25 at 

2:00 p.m. 
Angus Gillespie, author of 

“Port Newark and the Origins 
of Container Shipping,” takes 
us behind the scenes of to-
day’s active container ship-
ping operations in Port New-
ark, talking to the pilots who 
guide the ships into port, the 
Coast Guard personnel who 
help manage the massive 
shipping traffic, the crews 
who unload the containers, 
and even the chaplains who 
counsel and support the 
mariners. Port Newark 
shines a spotlight on the un-
sung men and women who 
help this complex global 
shipping operation run 
smoothly. This program will 
be held in-person at the Li-
brary. Register at the Wel-
come Desk, on our website 
at www.monroetwplibrary. 
org/calendar or by phone at 
(732) 521-5000. 

Black History Month 
 Book Discussion 

Monday, February 27 at 
2:00 p.m. 

Join us for a discussion 
about “A Most Beautiful 

Thing: The True Story of 
America’s First All-Black 
High School Rowing Team” 
by Arshay Cooper. Spon-
sored by the Friends of the 
Monroe Township Library. 
This is a hybrid program. 
Join us via Zoom or in per-
son. Registration is required. 
Register at the Welcome 
Desk, on our website at 
www.monroetwplibrary.org/
calendar or by phone at 
(732) 521-5000. 

Cholesterol Screening 
Tuesday, February 28 from 

1:30 p.m. until 3:00 p.m. 
February is American 

Heart Month. Check your 
cholesterol and take care of 
your cardiovascular health. 
Screenings provided by Saint 
Peter’s University Hospital. 
Registration is required. Reg-
ister at the Welcome Desk, 
on  o u r  we b s i t e  a t 
www.monroetwplibrary.org/
calendar or by phone at 
(732) 521-5000. 

Device Advice 
Need one-on-one tech 

help? Register for a 45-
minute one-on-one session 
for assistance with your 
phone, tablet, laptop or any 
technology device, e.g. navi-
gating our website and online 
resources, how to use an 
iPad, tablet, Kindle, smart-
phone, laptop or other de-
vice, download books and 
media onto your device, how 
to access your email ac-
count. Registration is re-
quired. Register at the Refer-
ence Desk, online at 
www.monroetwplibrary.org/
calendar or by phone at 
(732) 521-5000. 

Winter Reading Challenge 
The 2023 Winter Reading 

Challenge is here! Read a 
book pertaining to a selected 
genre and enter a raffle every 
month to win prizes! January’s 
theme is historical fiction, Feb-
ruary is memoir/biography and 
March is science fiction. Sub-
mit your entry tickets at the 
Welcome Desk. Please pro-
vide a valid email address or 
phone number. 

February at the Monroe Township Public Library 

Home  

Improvement & 

Services 

T-K-S HOME IMPROVE-
MENTS – Full service contrac-
tor. Kitchen, baths, base-
ments, painting, tile and more. 
No job too big or small. Li-
cense #13VH05970500. (609) 
259-2574. 
 
JOHN PEARL HOME IM-
PROVEMENT AND LAND-
SCAPING, LLC – General 
repairs and handyman work, 
painting, flooring, tile, deck 
repairs, powerwashing, land-
scape projects, and more. Li-
censed and insured. 
#13VH06515700. (908) 208-
1150.  
 
RELIABLE HANDYMAN 
SERVICES – Local resident. 
No job too small. All labor 
guaranteed. Call me to discuss 
– no obligation. Reasonable 
rates. Call (609) 409-7096 or 
(908) 385-5869. 
 
MIKE THE HANDYMAN – 
See my display ad in this edi-
tion. (732) 780-0468. 
 

Tax Preparation 

GREGORY TAX SERVICE—
Reasonable, friendly service. 
35 years experience, IRS 
AFSP. Concordia resident, Jim 
Gregory. (732) 236-4498. 
 
 

Miscellaneous/

Services 

TECH BUDDY – Simple step-
by-step help with smart-
phones, computers and tab-
lets. Large print solutions for 
low tech problems. Beginner to 
Advanced. Patience and en-
thusiasm included. Wireless 
printers, Netflix, Amazon Alexa 
setup and training. Have Alexa 
remind you of your appoint-
ments, read audiobooks, 
more. $5 off setup. Free quote. 
(732) 589-4974. 
techbuddybarb@aol.com  
 
COMPUTERS CUSTOM 
BUILT & REPAIRED - RJF 
Sales Company LLC.* Time to 
clean your computer and get 
educated on protecting your-
self from scams. Desktop and 
laptop repair in your home. I 
am fully vaccinated; I use a 
mask. Virus removal and pro-
tection. Monroe resident with 
over 20 years of computer 
experience. (732) 723-9537 or 
(732) 967-3400. Please leave 
message; most calls returned 
same day. 
 
 

Help & Health 

Services 

AT ANGEL TOUCH HOME 
CARE we provide excellent 
care for the elderly with li-
censed, insured and bonded 
thoroughly screened aides. 
We are a company that cares 
for our patients and makes 
sure they are treated by the 
best. 24-hour care (living with 
resident). Elderly companion-
ship. Call (609) 907-6059. 
 
PROFESSIONAL CARE-
GIVER is looking for live-in/
live-out job in Monroe. Low 
prices. Call Lisa (732) 715-
0711. 
 

ANNA’S HOME CARE – Cer-
tified professional caregiver is 
looking for live-in/live-out job in 
Monroe Township. Experi-
enced, references. Driver’s 
license. Accepts long-term 
care insurance. Low prices. 
Private care option. Call 
Anna at (609) 917-4208 or 
(908) 337-7462. 
 

EXPERIENCED IN HOME-
CARE—Certified nurse assis-
tant seeks part-time compan-
ionship position. References, 
background check, clean driv-
ers license, also cooks. Con-
tact Peggy at (609) 395-0141. 
 

DO YOU NEED A CARE-
GIVER? I have more than 10 
years of experience. Please 
call (856) 394-0430. 
 

Wanted to Buy 

BUYING & SELLING GUNS – 
Call for pricing. (609) 558-
9509. Ask for David. Licensed 
Firearms Dealer. 
 

Transportation 

AAA TRANSPORTATION—
Monroe area. (Encore resi-
dent.) Transportation to air-
ports, trains, piers, NYC, and I 
will drive your car to and from 
Florida. Reasonable rates. Call 
Howard (732) 979-3085. 
 

LIMO GUY — Our 20th year. 
We go almost anywhere. Up-
graded SUVs. $100 to Newark 
Airport. $205 Philadelphia. 
$205 JFK. We go almost any-
where. 24/7. Call (732) 803-
2521. 
 

ARNIE’S DRIVING SERVICE. 
Anywhere. Anytime. Airport 
and NYC specialist. 609-751-
1612. 
 

TOM’S TRANSPORTATION— 
Door 2 Door service. Call 
(609) 917-5600. 
 

House Cleaning 

HOUSE CLEANING—25 Years 
of experience. Good work. Call 
Inna at (609) 456-8006. 
 

HOUSE CLEANING to clean 
your home. Excellent refer-
ences, courteous and experi-
enced. Please call (609) 371-
4775. 
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19 20 21 22 23 24 25 

9:30 am Arch .Comm. CON 
9:30 am Ballroom Dance CC 
10 am Men’s Table Tennis 

CC 
11 am Woodshop WS 
12:30 pm Duplicate Bridge 

MPR 
1 pm Fiber Arts CER 
3:45 pm Yoga with Rama 

BR 
6 pm Sec. 15 Board Mtg. 

CON 
6 pm Stained Glass Class 

AS 
6:30 pm Billiards Clinic BIL 
7 pm Ballroom Dance CC 
 

9:30 am Ballroom Dance CC 
10 am Men’s Table Tennis 

CC 
11 am Woodshop WS 
12:30 pm Duplicate Bridge 

MPR 
1 pm Fiber Arts CER 
3:45 pm Yoga with Rama 

BR 
6 pm Stained Glass Class 

AS 
6:30 pm Billiards Clinic BIL 
7 pm Ballroom Dance CC 
7 pm Sec. 12 Open Mtg. LA 
 
 

SUNDAY MONDAY TUESDAY WEDNESDAY THURSDAY FRIDAY SATURDAY 

   1 2 3 

5 6 7 8 9 10 11 

12 13 14 15 16 17 18 

26 27 28  

10 am Men’s Table Tennis 
CC 

11 am Woodshop WS 
1 pm Diamond Painting CER 
1:30 pm Sec. 12 Board Mtg. 

CON 
5:30 pm Cornhole CC 
6 pm Stained Glass Class 

AS 
7 pm Pinochle CER 
7:30 pm Chinese Dance LB 
 

9 am Ceramics Club CER 
10 am Activities Comm. Mtg. 

MPR 
10 am Current Events CON 
10 am Women’s Table 

Tennis CC 
11 am Pool Comm. Mtg. CON 
11 am Tap Your Troubles 

Away CC 
11 am Woodshop WS 
12:30 pm Dup. Bridge LA 
1 pm Scrabble Games MPR 
2 pm Blanket Making LB 
3 pm Mandolin CER 
6 pm Boomers Ticket Sales 

Super Bowl LB 
7 pm Meditation CON 
7 pm Stage Production CC 
7 pm WS - Ladies Night WS 

10 am Men’s Table Tennis 
CC 

11 am Woodshop WS 
6 pm Boomers Board Mtg. 

CON 
 
 
 
 

10 am Covid Vaccines LB 
10 am Men’s Table Tennis 

CC 
11 am Woodshop WS 
1 pm New Horizons 

Socrates Cafe LA 
1 pm Diamond Painting CER 
5:30 pm Cornhole CC 
6 pm Stained Glass Class 

AS 
7 pm Zumba BR 
7 pm Pinochle CER 
7:30 pm Chinese Dance LB 
 

9 am Ceramics Club CER 
10 am Current Events CON 
10 am Women’s Table 

Tennis CC 
11 am New Horizons Board 

Mtg. LA 
11 am Tap Your Troubles 

Away CC 
11 am Woodshop WS 
12:30 pm Duplicate Bridge 

LB 
1 pm Scrabble Games MPR 
3 pm Mandolin CER 
6 pm Boomers Ticket Sales 

Super Bowl LB 
7 pm Pickwick Village Sec. 

15 Open Mtg. MPR 
7 pm Stage Production CC 
7 pm WS - Ladies Night WS 

10 am February $5 Dance - 
Setup CC 

10 am Men’s Table Tennis 
CC 

11 am Woodshop WS 
7 pm Movie BR 
 
 

 
 
 

9 am Stained Glass Class 
AS 

10 am Women’s Table 
Tennis CC 

11 am Woodshop WS 
1 pm Movie BR 
6 pm Boomers Ticket Sales 

Super Bowl LB 
6:45 pm Cribbage CER 
7 pm Line Dancing BR 
7 pm Presidents Council 

MPR 
7 pm Stage Production CC 
 
 

10 am Men’s Table Tennis 
CC 

11 am Woodshop WS 
1 pm Diamond Painting 

CER 
2 pm Computer Club Mtg. 

LB 
5:30 pm Cornhole CC 
6 pm Stained Glass Class 

AS 
7 pm Zumba BR 
7 pm JCC Board Mtg. LA 
7 pm Pinochle CER 
7:30 pm Chinese Dance LB 
 
 

9 am Ceramics Club CER 
10 am Current Events CON 
10 am Women’s Table 

Tennis CC 
11 am Tap Your Troubles 

Away CC 
11 am Woodshop WS 
12:30 pm Duplicate Bridge 

LA 
1 pm Scrabble Games MPR 
3 pm Mandolin CER 
6 pm Sec. 18A Board Mtg. 

MPR 
7 pm Meditation LA 
7 pm Sec. 2 Board Mtg. CON 
7 pm Stage Production CC 
7 pm WS - Ladies Night WS 
 

10 am Men’s Table Tennis 
CC 

11 am Woodshop WS 
1 pm Christian Fellowship 

Mtg. LA 
1 pm Christian Fellowship 

Mtg. LB 
7:30 pm JCC Friday Night 

Services CC 

5 pm Boomer’s Super Bowl 
Party CC 

 

9 am CCA Work Session 
MPR 

9 am Stained Glass Class AS 
10 am Women’s Table 

Tennis CC 
11 am Woodshop WS 
11:30 am VOC Mtg. MPR 
6:45 pm Cribbage CER 
7 pm Line Dancing BR 
7 pm Sec. 4 Board Mtg. CON 
7 pm Sec. 18B Board Mtg. 

MPR 
7 pm Stage Production CC 
 
 

10 am Men’s Table Tennis 
CC 

11 am Woodshop WS 
1 pm Diamond Painting CER 
4 pm Indian American Club 

LA 
5 pm Cornhole CC 
6 pm Stained Glass Class 

AS 
7 pm CCA Open Board Mtg. 

BR 
7 pm Zumba CC 
7 pm Pinochle CER 
7:30 pm Chinese Dance LB 
 
 

9 am Ceramics Club CER 
10 am Current Events CON 
10 am Women’s Table 

Tennis CC 
11 am Tap Your Troubles 

Away CC 
11 am Woodshop WS 
12:30 pm Dup. Bridge LA 
1 pm Art Appreciation Open 

Mtg. LB 
1 pm Scrabble Games MPR 
3 pm Mandolin CER 
7 pm Republican Club LB 
7 pm Stage Production CC 
7 pm WS - Ladies Night WS 
 

10 am Veterans Ceremony 
BR 

10 am Men’s Table Tennis 
CC 

11 am Woodshop WS 
6 pm Boomers Board Mtg. 

CON 
 
 

10 am JCC Celebration BR 
 
 

1 pm Sec. 16 Valentines 
Pot Luck CC 

 

9 am CCA Executive 
Session MPR 

9 am Stained Glass Class 
AS 

10 am Women’s Table 
Tennis CC 

11 am Woodshop WS 
6 pm Sec. 16 Open Mtg. LA 
6 pm Sec. 16 Open Mtg. LB 
6:45 pm Cribbage CER 
7 pm Line Dancing BR 
7 pm Stage Production CC 
 

  
 

9:30 am Ballroom Dance 
CC 

10 am Men’s Table Tennis 
CC 

11 am Woodshop WS 
12:30 pm Duplicate Bridge 

MPR 
1 pm Fiber Arts CER 
3:45 pm Yoga with Rama 

BR 
6 pm Stained Glass Class 

AS 
6:30 pm Billiards Clinic BIL 
7 pm Ballroom Dance CC 
 
 

9 am Stained Glass Class 
AS 

10 am Women’s Table 
Tennis CC 

11 am Woodshop WS 
11:30 am VOC Mtg. MPR 
1 pm New Horizons Read 

My Tips LA 
6:45 pm Cribbage CER 
7 pm Line Dancing BR 
7 pm Sec. 11 Board Mtg. 

CON 
7 pm Stage Production CC 
 

9 am Energy/ Green Comm. 
Mtg. LA 

9 am Sec. 9 Bd.d Mtg. CON 
9:30 am Ballroom Dance 

CC 
10 am Men’s Table Tennis 

CC 
11 am Woodshop WS 
12:30 pm Dup. Bridge MPR 
1 pm Fiber Arts CER 
3:45 pm Yoga with Rama 

BR 
6 pm Stained Glass Class 

AS 
6:30 pm Billiards Clinic BIL 
7 pm Self Defense Class 

BR 
7 pm Ballroom Dance CC 
7 pm Democratic Club  LA 

 
 
 

 

Schedule does not reflect 
changes made after 
the 15th of the month. 

8 am Scrap Booking/ Card 
Making CER 

7 pm $5 Dance CC 
 
 

 

TRASH PICK UP/RECYCLING  

TRASH PICK UP/RECYCLING  

TRASH PICK UP/RECYCLING  

ABBREVIATIONS 
CON = Conference Room 
BR = Ballroom 
CC = Cultural Center 
LA = Lounge A 
LB = Lounge B 
CER = Ceramics Room 
BIL = Billiards Room 
MPR = Multipurpose Room 
WS = Woodshop 
COM = Computer Room 
PL = Parking Lot 

4 

All Events  

Are Subject  

to Change. 

TRASH PICK UP/RECYCLING  

PRESIDENTS’ DAY 
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